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AGENDA 
REGULAR  MEETING 

APRIL 1st,  2013 
4:30 p.m. 

 
 
 
 
At appropriate places in this agenda, the names of people have been removed or edited out 
so as to comply with the Newfoundland and Labrador Access to Information and 
Protection of Privacy Act. 
 
1. Call to Order 

 
2. Approval of the Agenda  
 
3. Adoption of the Minutes 
 
 a. Minutes of March 25th,   2013 
 
4.  Business Arising from the Minutes     
   

A.   Included in the Agenda 
 
i. Memorandum dated March 27, 2013 from the Acting Director of Planning 

Re:  Development Fee and Subdivision Application Fee 
St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment No. 556, 2013 
 

ii. Memorandum dated March 26, 2013 fr4om the Acting Director of Planning 
       Re:  Proposed Hotel Development 227-229 Kenmount  Road  (Ward 4) 
       Applicant:  Pacific Coast Architecture for Northwood Properties Inc. 
 

B.   Other Matters 
 

C.  Notices Published         
 
 

 5. Public Hearings        
 
6. Committee Reports    
 

a. Finance and Administration Standing Committee Report dated March 21, 2013 
 

7. Resolutions  
 
8. Development Permits List  

 
9. Building Permits List  
 
10. Requisitions, Payrolls and Accounts       
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11. Tenders  
 

a. Tender – Rental of  Cars and Trucks 
 

b. Tender – Garbage and Recycling Bags 
 

c. Tender - St. John's Convention Centre Expansion 
                   CP #4 - Main Building 
 

d. Tender – Plumbing & Maintenance/Service Contract 
 

e. Tender – Cleaning Services  
 

f. Tender – Aerial Photography and Digital Orthophotography 
   

 
12. Notices of Motion, Written Questions and Petitions    

 
13. Other Business   
 

a. Memorandum dated March 27, 2013 from the Acting Director of Planning 
Re:  Parking  Standards for Movie Theatres 
St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment No. 566, 2013 

 
b. Memorandum dated March 27, 2013 from the Deputy City Manager/Director of 

Corporate Services & City Clerk Re: Travel by Councillor Hanlon   
 

c. Snow Clearing Report for the period January 1 to March 29, 2013 
 
d. Economic Update 

  
e. Correspondence from the Mayor’s Office     

 
f. Items Added by Motion 

 
   14. Adjournment  



   

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

        March 28
th

,   2013 

 

 

 

 

 

In accordance with Section 42 of the City of St. John’s Act,   the  Regular Meeting of the St. 

John’s Municipal Council will be held on Monday,  April 1
st
,  2013 at 4:30 p.m. 

  

This meeting will be preceded by a Special Meeting to be held on the same day in Conference 

Room A  at  3:30 pm    

 

 

 

By Order 

 

 

 

 

Neil A. Martin 

City Clerk 



                                                                                                                 March 25th,   2013 
  

The Regular Meeting of the St. John’s Municipal Council was held in the Council 

Chamber, City Hall, at 4:30 p.m. today. 

 
His Worship the Mayor presided. 
 
There were present also:  Councilors O’Leary; Hickman, Hann,  Breen, Galgay,  Tilley, 

Hanlon and Collins.  

     

Regrets:  Deputy Mayor Duff and Councillor Colbert. 

 

City Manager, Deputy City Manager/Director of Corporate Services & City Clerk,   

Deputy City Manager/Director of Public Works & Parks, Acting Director of Planning, 

Director of Engineering, Acting City Solicitor and Manager, Corporate Secretariat were 

also in attendance.     

 

The deliberations of Council were interrupted by Mayoral candidate, Geoff Chaulk,  who 

was present in the public gallery.  His Worship the Mayor temporarily adjourned the 

meeting and ordered the Commissioner to address the situation.   

  

Call to Order and Adoption of the Agenda 
 

SJMC2013-03-25/131R 
It was decided on motion of Councillor Collins; seconded by Councillor 
Breen: That the Agenda be adopted as presented. 
  
 

Adoption of Minutes 
 

SJMC2013-03-25/132R 
It was decided on motion of  Councillor Galgay; seconded by Councillor 
Hickman: That the minutes of March 19th, 2013 meeting be adopted as 
presented.  
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Business Arising 

Memorandum dated March 21, 2013 from the Acting Director of Planning 
Re:  Proposed Expansion to Existing Quarry, East White Hills Road  (Ward 1) 
Applicant:  Capital Ready-Mix Ltd.___________________________________  

Under business arising, Council considered a memorandum dated March 21, 2013 from 

the Acting Director of Planning regarding the above noted.   Also considered were three 

submissions to Council on the proposed rezoning.   It was noted that the area to be 

quarried is further removed from the residents than previous work,  and further the 

Province will require a blasting plan as well as a dust analysis and control plan prior to 

granting approval.  It was also noted that a public hearing on the proposed amendments, 

chaired by an independent commissioner, will be required.  

 SJMC2013-03-25/133R 
It was moved by Councillor Hann;  seconded by Councillor Breen:  That 
staff be directed to proceed with the rezoning of two parcels of land along 
East White Hills, each parcel to be rezoned to the Industrial General Zone 
(IG) Zone to allow expansion of the company’s quarry operations; and 
prepare the necessary amendments to the St. John’s Municipal Plan and St. 
John’s Development Regulations as well as approach the Department of 
Municipal Affairs concerning the Regional Plan amendment for Parcel A. 
 
  The motion being put was unanimously carried.  

Notices Published 

 
1. A Discretionary Use Application has been submitted by Toyota Plaza 
requesting permission to develop the rear property of Civic No. 73 Kenmount 
Road into a 300 space vehicle storage yard.   (Ward 4) 
 

 SJMC2013-03-25/134R 
It was moved by Councillor Tilley;  seconded by Councillor Collins:  
That the application be approved, subject to all applicable City 
requirements. 
 
 The motion being put was unanimously carried.  
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2. A Discretionary Use Application has been submitted requesting 
permission to occupy Civic No. 5 Lewisporte Place as a home occupation for 
a hair salon. The proposed business will occupy a floor area of approximately 
15.6 m2 in the basement area and will operate Wednesday and Friday 9 a.m. to 5 
p.m., and Thursday 10 a.m. to 8 p.m. One client will visit at a time by 
appointment only. A minimum of four on-site parking spaces are available for the 
business.  The applicant is the sole employee.  (Ward 3) 
 

One (1)  Submission  
 

SJMC2013-03-25/135R 
It was moved by Councillor Tilley; seconded by Councillor Collins: 
That the application be approved, subject to all applicable City 
requirements. 
 
 The motion being put was unanimously carried.  
 

3. A Discretionary Use Application has been submitted for a proposed home 
occupation at Civic No. 25 Brad Gushue Crescent for a wedding planning and 
decorating business. The proposed business will occupy a total floor area of 
approximately 35.6 m2 and will operate on an appointment basis only, with less 
than one client appointment per week. The business involves meeting with clients 
to discuss wedding plans and decoration of off-site venues. The office includes a 
decoration showroom which can be viewed by appointment only and is not open 
to the public. One on-site parking space is provided for the business.   The 
applicant is the sole employee. (Ward 5) 

SJMC2013-03-25/136R 
It was moved by Councillor Tilley; seconded by Councillor Collins:   
That the application be approved, subject to all applicable City 
requirements. 
 
 The motion being put was unanimously carried. 

  
 
Public Hearing Report 
   
Council considered a Public Hearing Report dated March 7, 2013 which was held to provide 

an opportunity for public review and comment on the application by Reardon Construction 

and Development to rezone property on Ruby Line at Southlands Boulevard from the 

Commercial Office Hotel (COH) and Open Space (O) Zones to the Residential Medium 

Density (R2), Apartment Medium Density (A2), and Open Space (O) Zones. 
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SJMC2013-03-25/137R 
It was moved by Councillor Hann;  seconded by Councillor O’Leary: That 
staff be directed to proceed with the rezoning and prepare the necessary 
amendments for rezoning and for amending the St. John’s Municipal Plan; 
and agreed that a commissioner’s public hearing for the Municipal Plan 
amendment be scheduled. 

 
The motion being put was unanimously carried.  

 
 
Development Committee Report dated  March 19th, 2013 
 
Council considered the following Development Committee Report dated March 19th, 2013: 

 
The following matters were considered by the Development Committee at its meeting held on 
March 19, 2013.  A staff report is attached for Council’s information.    
 
1. Proposed Change in Building Line Setback 
 Adjacent Civic No. 331 Thorburn Road (Ward 4) 
 Rural Residential (RR) Zone 
 

It is the recommendation of the Development Committee to approve a 7 meter 
Building Line for this property, with the requirement that the applicant must not 
build within 20 meters of the front property line. 

 
Robert F. Smart 
City Manager 
Chair – Development Committee 
 

SJMC2013-03-25/138R 
It was moved by Councillor Hann;  seconded by Councillor Collins: That the 
Committee’s recommendation  be approved. 
 
 The motion being put was unanimously carried. 
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Development Permits List 

Council considered as information the following Development Permits List for the period 

March 15 to 21, 2013: 

 
 

DEVELOPMENT PERMITS LIST 
DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING 

FOR THE PERIOD OF March 15, 2013 TO March 21, 2013 
           
       

 
Code  

 
Applicant 

 
Application 

 
Location 

 
Ward 

 
Development 
Officer's Decision 

 
Date 

COM  Home Office – 
Internet Marketing 

29A Point 
Leamington Street 

3 Approved 13-03-19 

AG  Proposed Laydown 
Area for Heavy 
Equipment 

197 Brookfield Road 5 Rejected by 
LDAA – 
Contrary to 
development in 
AG zone 

13-03-20 

AG  Second Driveway  197 Brookfield Road 5 Approved 13-03-20 
AG  Proposed Subdivision 

for 2 Building Lots 
Ruby Line 5 Rejected by 

LDAA – 
Contrary to 
development in 
AG zone 

13-03-21 

COM  Home Office – Mural 
Painting Business 

12A Sinnott Place 5 Approved 13-03-21 

       
       
       
       
       
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
* Code Classification: 

RES    - Residential INST - Institutional 
COM    - Commercial IND - Industrial  
AG        - Agriculture 
OT         - Other 

 
 

 
Gerard Doran 
Development Officer 
Department of Planning 
 
 
 
 
 

** This list is issued for information purposes only.  Applicants have been advised in 
writing of the Development Officer's decision and of their right to appeal any decision 
to the St. John's Local Board of Appeal. 
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Building Permits List 

SJMC2013-03-25/139R 
It was moved by Councillor Hanlon;  seconded by Councillor Galgay:  That 
the recommendation of the  Director of Building and Property Management 
with respect to the following Building Permits List be approved:  
 

Building Permits List 
Council’s March 25, 2013 Regular Meeting 

 
                               Permits Issued:      2013/03/14 To 2013/003/20 
 

 Class: Commercial 

 61 James Lane                         Co   Custom Workshop 
 15 International Pl                   Sn   Office 
 199 Kenmount Rd                       Sn   Hotel 
 199 Kenmount Rd                       Sn   Hotel 
 446 Newfoundland Dr                   Ms   Service Shop 
 48 Kenmount Rd, Avalon Mall           Co   Eating Establishment 
 61 James Lane -Amj Campbell           Co   Office 
 15 George St                          Rn   Tavern 
 61 James Lane                         Rn   Warehouse 
 61 James Lane                         Rn   Warehouse 
 220 Kenmount Rd, Penny Mazda          Rn   Car Sales Lot 
 79 Kenmount Rd                        Cr   Office 

                                                                This Week $    427,500.00 

 Class: Industrial 

                                                                This Week $           .00 

 Class: Government/Institutional 

                                                                This Week $           .00 

 Class: Residential 

 227 Brookfield Rd                     Nc   Accessory Building 
 28 Hatcher St                         Nc   Accessory Building 
 4 Kenai Cres, Lot 178                 Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 
 88 Kenai Cres, Lot 219                Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 
 125 Ladysmith Dr - Lot 194            Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 
 45 Brad Gushue Cres                   Co   Single Detached Dwelling 
 191 Topsail Rd                        Co   Single Detached Dwelling 
 64 Cornwall Cres                      Cr   Subsidiary Apartment 
 26 Maxwell Pl                         Ex   Single Detached Dwelling 
 89-91 Casey St                        Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 
 22 Circular Rd                        Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 
 13 Coronation St                      Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 
 10 Galashiels Pl                      Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 
 163 Ladysmith Dr, Lot 340             Rn   Subsidiary Apartment 
 46 Newtown Rd                         Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 
 64 Queen's Rd                         Rn   Townhousing 
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 10 St. Andrew's Pl                    Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 
 30 Ropewalk Lane                      Sn   Eating Establishment 

                                                                This Week $    812,000.00 

 Class: Demolition 

                                                                This Week $           .00 

                                                      This Week's Total: $   1,239,500.00 

                     Repair Permits Issued:  2013/03/14 To 2013/03/20 $         48,200.00 

                                   Legend 

 Co  Change Of Occupancy        Sn  Sign 
 Cr  Chng Of Occ/Renovtns       Ms  Mobile Sign 
 Ex  Extension                  Cc  Chimney Construction 
 Nc  New Construction           Cd  Chimney Demolition 
 Oc  Occupant Change            Dv  Development File 
 Rn  Renovations                Ws  Woodstove 
 Sw  Site Work                  Dm  Demolition 
 Ti  Tenant Improvements 

 

Year To Date Comparisons 

       March 25, 2013   

        

Type 2012 2013 % Variance (+/-) 

Commercial $19,700,400.00 $33,000,600.00 68 

Industrial $1,300,100.00 $25,000.00 -98 

Government/Institutional $8,600,900.00 $6,800,100.00 -21 

Residential $25,100,400.00 $19,200,600.00 -24 

Repairs $600,800.00 $500,100.00 -17 

Housing Units (1 & 2 Family Dwellings) 71 54   

Total $55,302,600.00 $59,526,400.00 8 
 
Respectfully Submitted, 

 
 

David Blackmore, R.P.A. 
Director Of Building & Property Management 
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Payrolls and Accounts 
 

SJMC2013-03-25/140R 
It was moved by Councillor Hanlon;  seconded by Councillor Galgay:  That 
the following Payrolls and Accounts for the week ending March  21st ,  2013  
be approved:  
 

Weekly Payment Vouchers 
For The 

Week Ending March 21, 2013 
 

 
 
Payroll 
 
Public Works                                                                             $  440,218.87 
 
Bi-Weekly Casual                                                                      $    20,981.14 
 
Accounts Payable                                                                       $2,381,926.86 
 
 
 
 
                                       Total:                                 $2,843,126.87 
 

 

 The motion being put was unanimously carried.    

 

Other Business 

 

Manga Hotels – New Gower Street 

 
Council considered a memorandum dated March 19, 2013 from the City Solicitor 

regarding the above noted. 

 
 SJMC2013-03-25/141R 

It was moved by Councillor Galgay;  seconded by Councillor Tilley:  That  a 
request from Manga Hotels Limited to purchase a parcel of surplus lands 
from the City located between their site at the corner of Springdale/New 
Gower  Streets and the sidewalk at New Gower Street, be approved, and sold 
at a rate of $45.00 per square foot (approximately $100,000) plus HST. 

 
 The motion being put was unanimously carried.  
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Snow Clearing Report for the period January 1st  to March 22nd, 2013 
 
Council considered as information the snow clearing report for the period January 1 to 

March 22, 2013 showing a positive variance of  $61,100. 

  
Notice to Motorists -  Recision of On-Street Parking 

Council considered Notices to Motorists advising that effective Monday,  April 1, 2013 

the overnight On-Street Parking ban is no longer in effect. 

 

Councillor O’Leary 

Councillor O’Leary reported on the recent closed meeting held with a number of 

stakeholders including city staff , Councillor Galgay and representatives of the  

RNC to discuss the problems experienced on Tessier Place and surrounding area. 

She noted that the meeting was a major first step   in bringing not only the 

community together  but all parties who will work collectively towards  creating a 

safer neighbourhood.  Councillor O’Leary advised that a  larger public meeting 

has been scheduled for April 3, 2013.  

 
 Councillor Breen 
 

Councillor Breen advised that he has  received enquiries concerning the lack of a 

sidewalk on the north side of Stavanger Drive from Torbay Road down to the 

Dominion Stores, in front of Best Buys location. He noted that there is a plan for a 

sidewalk at this location, however, sidewalks cannot be installed until the planned   

turning lane on Stavanger Drive turning right onto Torbay Road is installed. He 

further noted that the funding for the sidewalk has been held as security by the 

developer and as soon as the turning lane is installed the sidewalk will be installed 

as originally planned. 
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Adjournment 
 
There being no further business, the meeting adjourned at 5:30 p.m.  
 
 
 
 
 
 

____________________________________ 
                                         MAYOR      
  
 
                ____________________________________ 
                           CITY CLERK 
 
 
   
 
 
. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 





















Report/Recommendations 
Finance and Administration Committee 

March 21, 2013 
 
 
In attendance: Councillor Danny Breen, Chairperson 
 Councillor Wally Collins 
 Councillor Sheilagh O’Leary 
 Councillor Tom Hann 
 Councillor Frank Galgay 
 Councillor Sandy Hickman 
 Mr. Bob Smart, City Manager 
 Mr. Neil Martin, Deputy City Manager/City Clerk 
 Mr. Paul Mackey, Director, Deputy City Manager/Director of Public  
  Works/Parks 
 Mr. Bob Bishop, Director of Finance/City Treasurer 
 Ms. Elizabeth Lawrence, Director of Economic Development, Tourism  
  and Culture 
 Ms. Jill Brewer, Director of Recreation 
 Mr. Sean Janes, City Auditor 
 Ms. Sandy Abbott, Recording Secretary 
 
 
1. Requests for Financial Support and Sponsorships 
 

The Committee considered memorandums from the City Clerk outlining requests from 
the following groups/organizations under the City’s policy for Conference Sponsorship: 
 
National Darts Federation of Canada: Request for the City to provide funding for four 
events taking place in St. John’s. Approximately 1,100 participants are anticipated. 
 
Newfoundland and Labrador Rugby Union: Request for the City to provide funding to 
host the 2013 Canadian Eastern Rugby Championship Tournament to be held July 
11-14, 2013. Approximately 400 people are anticipated. 
 
Canadian Technical Asphalt Association: Request for the City to provide funding to 
host the 58th Annual CTAA Conference to be held November 17-20, 2013. 
Approximately 350-400 participants are anticipated. 
 
Department of Geography, MUN: Request for the City to provide funding to host the 
Annual Meeting of the Canadian Association of Geographers to be held August 10-15, 
2013. Approximately 300 academics, professionals and students are anticipated. 
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Swimming Newfoundland and Labrador: Request for the City to provide funding to 
host the East Coast Swimming Long Course Championships to be held July 4-7, 
2013. Approximately 360 swimmers are anticipated. 
 
United Ostomy Association of Canada Inc.: Request for the City to provide funding 
to host their national conference. Approximately 350 attendees are anticipated. 
 
Oceanex Eastern Canadian Gymnastics Championships: Request for the City to 
provide funding to host the 2013 Oceanex Eastern Canadian Gymnastics 
Championships in St. John’s. Over 1,000 athletes, coaches, judges, families and 
spectators are anticipated. 
 
NL 5 Pin Bowlers’ Association: Request for the City to provide funding to host the 
Canadian 5 Pin Bowlers’ Association National Open Tournament in St. John’s. 
Approximately 375 people are anticipated. 
 
Supporting documentation for the requests was reviewed and the following 
recommendation is brought forward: 
 
The Committee recommends the following contributions in accordance with 
Policy No. 04-09-02: 
 

1. National Darts Federation of Canada (Councillor Collins dissented)  .................  $2,000.00 
2. Newfoundland and Labrador Rugby Union  ....................................................  $750.00 
3. Canadian Technical Asphalt Association  .......................................................  $750.00 
4. Department of Geography, MUN  .....................................................................  $750.00 
5. Swimming NL: $1500 approved (Councillor Collins dissented)  .......................  $1,500.00 
6. United Ostomy Association of Canada Inc.  ....................................................  $750.00 
7. Oceanex Eastern Canadian Gymnastics Championships . ...........................  $1,500.00 
8. Newfoundland and Labrador 5 Pin Bowlers’ Association  ................................. $750.00 
 

2. Big Brothers Big Sisters Canada 
 

The Committee received a request for a donation of $100.00 towards the100th 
Anniversary of Big Brothers Big Sisters of Canada:   
 

The Committee recommends approval of a donation of $100.00 
towards the 100th Anniversary of Big Brothers Big Sisters.  

 
3. Municipalities Newfoundland and Labrador 

 
The Committee received a request for financial support of $2,000.00 towards a Meet 
and Greet Event of Municipalities NL to be held March 15-17, 2013:    
 

The Committee recommends that no action is required as this event 
has already occurred and has been dealt with previously. 
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4. Faculty of Business Administration, MUN 
 
The Committee received a request for financial sponsorship from the Faculty of Business 
Administration, MUN, towards the 48th Annual Business Day held on March 15, 2013:  

 

The Committee recommends that no action is required as this event 
has already occurred.  
 

5. Lady Cove Women’s Choir 
 

The Committee received a request for financial assistance from Lady Cove Women’s 
Choir re their 10th Anniversary. 
 

The Committee recommends that Council reject the request for 
financial assistance to Lady Cove Women’s Choir’s 10th Anniversary 
as this application should have been made to the Grants to Artists 
fund.  

 
6. Atlantic Maple Leaf NL 2013 Tribute Dinner 

 
The Committee received a request for financial assistance towards the Atlantic Maple 
Leaf NL 2013 Tribute Dinner in support of military families to be held on June 27, 2013. 
 

The Committee recommends that Council reject the request for 
financial assistance towards the Atlantic Maple Leaf NL 2013 Tribute 
Dinner as this falls outside the parameters of the City’s funding 
policies. The Committee recommends, however, that in-kind support 
be provided. 

 
7. Royal Newfoundland Regiment Band 

 
The Committee received a request for financial assistance towards the purchase of 
Royal Newfoundland Regiment Band uniforms.   
 

The Committee recommends that Council reject the request for 
financial assistance towards the purchase of Royal Newfoundland 
Regiment Band uniforms as it falls outside the parameters of the 
City’s funding policies.  

 
8. Commercial Water Tax 
 

The Committee considered a memo dated March 19, 2013 from the Deputy City 
Manager, Financial Management, regarding the issuance of the first water tax bills 
for 2013 and the draft letter which will be circulated to these users in advance of the 
tax increase. The Committee concurred with the issuance of the draft letter, a copy 
of which is on file with the City Clerk’s Department. 
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9. Additional Grant Allocation – Sports Grant 
 

The Committee considered a memorandum dated March 20, 2013 from the Director 
of Recreation regarding the Department of Recreation’s review of an additional 
allocation of grants for sports organizations.  
 

A copy of the memorandum is attached to this Report. 
 

The Committee recommends Council’s approval of the course of 
action regarding the allocation of grants for sports organizations as 
outlined by the Director of Recreation in the memorandum.  

 
10. Special Events and Festivals Funds 

 

The Committee considered a memorandum dated March 20, 2013 from the Director 
of Economic Development, Tourism & Culture outlining the recommendations for 
funding allocation from the Special Events and Festivals Fund.  
 

A copy of the memorandum is attached to this Report. 
 

The Committee recommends Council’s approval of the 
recommendations of the Director of Economic Development, 
Tourism and Culture for funding allocation from the Special Events 
and Festivals Fund.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
       
Danny Breen, Chairperson 

   
 

Finance and Administration Meeting  March 21, 2013 
Reports/Recommendations  Page 4 
 







 

 
 
 

Date: March 20, 2013 

To: Councillor Danny Breen, Chair, Finance and Administration Committee 
  
From: Elizabeth Lawrence, Director, Department of Economic Development, Tourism & Culture 
  
Re:   2013 Special Events and Festivals Fund 
 
Applications for the 2013 Special Events and Festivals Fund were available December 31, 2012 with a 
submission deadline of February 8, 2013.  Several meetings of the Special Events & Festival Fund 
Internal Committee were held for the purpose of reviewing the 24 applications received with a total 
funding request of $171,607.  The maximum funding allocation for the Special Events and Festival Fund 
is $100,000.00.    
 
Last year the City received 24 applications having a total funding request of $234,000.  Twenty of the 24 
applicants received funding in 2012. 
 
Of the 24 applications received this year, three were referred to other internal funding programs and one 
did not meet the eligibility criteria. 
 
Applications were reviewed based on the following established criteria:   

• programming content and format 
• partnerships with organizations, volunteers, etc.  
• participants and audience 
• economic impacts 
• marketing 

 
Recommendations of the Committee are attached for Council’s review. 

 
 
 
 

 
 Elizabeth Lawrence 
 

cc  Bob Bishop 
Jill Brewer 
Bernadette Walsh  
Deborah Cook  
Carolyn Cook 

 



  Page 2 

 
 
 

2013 Special Events & Festivals Fund 
Committee Recommendations 

 
 
Bluegrass and Old-Time Country Music Jamboree $1,000 
Opera on the Avalon Summer Festival 5,000 
Festival of New Dance  3,400 
Pride week festival 500 
World Sound 2013 & Preparation for Sound Symposium XVII  2,500 
Wreckhouse International Jazz & Blues Festival 10,000 
Festival du Vent 2013 1,000 
St. John’s International Women’s Film Festival 10,000 
Mummers Festival 4,500 
Downtown St. John’s Busker Festival 4,500 
Lawnya Vawnya 4,000 
Newfoundland & Labrador Folk Festival 17,000 
Tuckamore Festival 6,500 
13th Annual Victoria Park Lantern Festival 5,000 
Summer Cultural Festival (RIAC) 500 
Nickel Independent Film Festival 7,000 
Shakespeare by the Sea 3,500 
Fishing for the Future Film Festival 500 
  
Total            $86,400 
 
The following amounts for in-kind services are also recommended for approval:   
 
Reel Downtown – Outdoor Movie Screening Series  $2,100 (in-kind)   
Tely 10 Mile Road Race     10,500 (in-kind) 
 
Total In-Kind $ 12,600 
 
Reserve* $   1,000 
 _______ 
 
TOTAL $100,000 
 
* As in the past, a reserve of $1,000 has been allocated for events which may come forward during the 
year.  Staff  have the authority for approval of up to $500 under this reserve. 
 



DEVELOPMENT PERMITS LIST 
DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING 

       FOR THE PERIOD OF March 22, 2013 TO March 28, 2013 
           

       
 

Code  
 

Applicant 
 

Application 
 

Location 
 

Ward 
 

Development 
Officer's Decision 

 
Date 

RES  Demolition and 
Rebuild of Dwelling 

61 Field Street 2 Approved 13-03-25 

RES  Subdivision of Lot 825-829 Main Road 5 Approved 13-03-22 
COM Yellow Belly 

Brewery 
Expansion of Brewery 288 Water Street 5 Approved 13-03-26 

COM Dexter 
Management 
Inc. 

Home Office 
Book Keeping 

72 Halley Drive 1 Approved 13-03-27 

AG  Change of Crown 
Land Lease into Grant 

423A Bay Bulls Road 5 Approved 13-03-27 

       
       
       
       
       
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
* Code Classification: 

RES - Residential INST - Institutional 
COM - Commercial IND - Industrial  
AG               - Agriculture 
OT               - Other 

 
 

 

** This list is issued for information purposes only.  Applicants have been advised in 
writing of the Development Officer's decision and of their right to appeal any decision 
to the St. John's Local Board of Appeal. 

 

 
             
         

 

 

 
Gerard Doran 
Development Officer 
Department of Planning 
 
 
 
 

 



Building Permits List 

Council’s April 1, 2013 Regular Meeting 

 
                               Permits Issued:      2013/03/21 To 2013/03/26 

 

 Class: Commercial 

 260 Portugal Cove Rd                  Co   Retail Store 

 48 Kenmount Rd, Jump Plus             Sn   Retail Store 

 699 Torbay Rd                         Ms   Eating Establishment 

 448 Water St                          Sn   Office 

 20 Crosbie Pl-3rd Floor               Rn   Office 

 75 Kelsey Dr Glazes Windscreen        Rn   Retail Store 

 336 Water St Second Cup               Rn   Eating Establishment 

 465 East White Hills Rd               Cr   Commercial Garage 

 This Week $    566,145.00 

 Class: Industrial 

 This Week $           .00 

 Class: Government/Institutional 

 This Week $           .00 

 Class: Residential 

 16 Douglas St, Lot 254                Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 

 42 Kenai Cres, Lot 196                Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 

 56 Kenai Cres                         Nc   Accessory Building 

 81 Ladysmith Dr , Lot 172             Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 

 26 Linegar Ave                        Nc   Accessory Building 

 26 Linegar Ave                        Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 

 33 Point Leamington St                Nc   Accessory Building 

 33 Tanner St                          Nc   Accessory Building 

 1 Sitka St, Lot 294                   Nc   Single Detached Dwelling 

 42 Castle Bridge Dr                   Co   Home Office 

 38 Rigolet Cres                       Cr   Subsidiary Apartment 

 120 University Ave                    Cr   Subsidiary Apartment 

 58 Barnes Rd                          Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 

 18 Blatch Ave                         Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 

 19 Cypress St                         Rn   Subsidiary Apartment 

 65 Feild St                           Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 

 7 Glenlonan St                        Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 

 45 New Cove Rd                        Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 

 64 Queen's Rd                         Rn   Townhousing 

 This Week $  1,572,300.00 

 Class: Demolition 

 6 Diefenbaker St                      Dm   Single Detached Dwelling 

 640 Empire Ave                        Dm   Townhousing 

 642 Empire Ave                        Dm   Townhousing 

 This Week $     15,000.00 

 This Week's Total: $   2,153,445.00 



 Repair Permits Issued:  2013/03/21 To 2013/03/26 $          2,000.00 

 Legend 

 Co  Change Of Occupancy        Sn  Sign 

 Cr  Chng Of Occ/Renovtns       Ms  Mobile Sign 

 Ex  Extension                  Cc  Chimney Construction 

 Nc  New Construction           Cd  Chimney Demolition 

 Oc  Occupant Change            Dv  Development File 

 Rn  Renovations                Ws  Woodstove 

 Sw  Site Work                  Dm  Demolition 

 Ti  Tenant Improvements 

 

Year To Date Comparisons 

       April 01, 2013   

  

 

    

Type 2012 2013 % Variance (+/-) 

Commercial $55,200,100.00 $33,600,800.00 -39 

Industrial $1,300,100.00 $25,000.00 -98 

Government/Institutional $8,600,900.00 $6,800,100.00 -21 

Residential $26,900,900.00 $20,800,900.00 -23 

Repairs $600,800.00 $500,100.00 -17 

Housing Units (1 & 2 Family Dwellings) 79 59   

Total $92,602,800.00 $61,726,900.00 -33 

   
Respectfully Submitted, 

 

 

 

 

 

David Blackmore, R.P.A. 

Director Of Building & Property Management 

 

















   

 

 

 

Date: March 25, 2013 

 Mr. Neil Martin, Ms. Margaret Bennett, Ms. Phyllis Bartlett  

  

From: John Hamilton – Senior Buyer  

  

Re:   Council Approval Tender 2013024 Rental of Cars and Trucks  

 
The results of Tender 2012024 Open Order for Rental of Cars and Trucks are as attached    
 
It is recommended to award this tender to the three vendors fully meeting specifications,  
as per the Public Tendering Act.   
 
-This tender is for the purpose of establishing a Price Agreement for Automobile Rentals.  
We are providing sources of supply at pre-arranged pricing and terms for the day to day 
operational needs of the various city departments. User departments will use Purchase 
Orders to purchase vehicles when required.  
 
The lowest bidder of items required will be approached first to supply. 
 
 
 
Taxes Extra  
 
 
 
 
 
 
John Hamilton 
Senior Buyer 



RENTAL OF VEHICLES
TENDER #2013024 - MARCH 19, 2013 - 1:00 PM

Thrifty Car Rental Daily Weekly Monthly 4 Month
Stake Dump No Bid
PickUp no cab $86.00 $516.00 $2,064.00 $8,050.00
Pick Up w/cab $109.00 $654.00 $2,616.00 $10,200.00
1/2 Ton Van No Bid
Compact Car $54.00 $324.00 $1,296.00 $5,054.00
Cube Van $89.00 $534.00 $1,849.00 $7,200.00
12-15 Pass. Van No Bid
7 Pass. Can $51.00 $326.00 $1,259.00 $4,800.00
4x4 PickUp $59.00 $534.00 $1,869.00 $7,289.00
4X4 SUV $58.00 $383.00 $1,439.00 $5,600.00

Centsible Practicar Car & Truck Rentals Daily Weekly Monthly 4 Month
Stake Dump No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PickUp no cab $49.00 $339.00 $1,338.00 $5,352.00
Pick Up w/cab $55.00 $369.00 $1,469.00 $5,876.00
1/2 Ton Van $53.00 $359.00 $1,399.00 $5,596.00
Compact Car $39.00 $234.00 $859.00 $3,436.00
Cube Van No Bid
12-15 Pass. Van No Bid
7 Pass. Can $50.00 $319.00 $1,249.00 $4,996.00
4x4 PickUp $59.00 $399.00 $1,495.00 $5,980.00
4X4 SUV $64.00 $419.00 $1,495.00 $5,980.00

Royal Garage Discount Daily Weekly Monthly 4 Month
Stake Dump $80.00 $520.00 $1,695.00 $6,780.00
PickUp no cab No Bid
Pick Up w/cab No Bid
1/2 Ton Van $54.00 $349.00 $1,349.00 $5,396.00
Compact Car $39.00 $239.00 $889.00 $3,556.00
Cube Van No Bid
12-15 Pass. Van No Bid
7 Pass. Can $52.00 $329.00 $1,269.00 $5,076.00
4x4 PickUp $62.00 $409.00 $1,549.00 $6,196.00
4X4 SUV $59.00 $389.00 $1,449.00 $5,796.00



   

 

  
 
 
 

Date: March 22, 2013 

To: Mr. Neil Martin, Ms. Margaret Bennett, Ms. Phyllis Bartlett.  
  
From: Chris Davis – Buyer 
  
Re:   Council Approval  

 
 
The results of Tender 2013021, Garbage and Recycling Bags are as follows. 
 
 
 

1.) Peter Pan Sales Limited   $51,274.86 
2.) B and B Sales Limited   $51,570.00 
3.) Al Pack Enterprises    $53,520.55 
4.) Best Dispensers Limited   $59,107.50 
5.) Best Dispensers Limited   $78,195.00 
 
 
 

It is recommended to award this tender to the lowest bidder meeting specifications,  
Peter Pan Sales Limited @ $51,274.86, as per the Public Tendering Act. 
 
 
 (Prices are Excluding HST) 

 
   
_____________________ 
Chris Davis 
 





 

 

 
 
 
 
 

Date: March 27, 2013 

To: Mayor Dennis O’Keefe 
and Members of Council 

  
From: David Blackmore, R.P.A. 

Director of Building & Property Management 
  
Re:   Results of Tender #2013028 

Plumbing Maintenance/Service Contract 
 
 
The above referenced project was recently tendered with only one bid received: 
 
King’s Plumbing and Heating Services $283,912.00 
 
                      
It is recommended that this tender be awarded to King’s Plumbing and Heating Services for the 
amount of $283,912.00 which includes HST and is for a three (3) year period. 
 
 
 
 
David Blackmore 
 
 



 

 

 
 
 
 
 

Date: March 27, 2013 

To: Mayor Dennis O’Keefe 
and Members of Council 

  
From: David Blackmore, R.P.A. 

Director of Building & Property Management 
  
Re:   Results of Tender #2013022 

Cleaning Services 
 
The above referenced project was recently tendered with the following results: 
 
Kelloway Construction 
Sub Package “A”  $553,200.00 total for duration of Contract before HST 
Sub Package “B”  $  69,600.00 total for duration of Contract before HST 
Sub Package “C”  $  76,800.00 total for duration of Contract before HST  
 
Bursey Cleaners  
 
Sub Package “A”  $682,064.64 total for duration of Contract before HST 
Sub Package “B”  $  72,253.00 total for duration of Contract before HST 
Sub Package “C”  $214,929.12 total for duration of Contract before HST  
 
ACE Cleaning Limited 
 
Sub Package “A”  No Bid 
Sub Package “B”  $  80,700.00 total for duration of Contract before HST 
Sub Package “C”  No Bid 
  
It is recommended to award this tender to the lowest bidder meeting specifications, Kelloway 
Construction, for the amounts indicated above.  Taxes are extra to quoted price. 
 
 
 
David Blackmore 
 











   

 

  

  

 

 

Date: March 27
th

, 2013  

To: His Worship the Mayor and Members of Council      

  

From: Deputy City Manager/Director of 

Corporate Services & City Clerk 

  

Re:   Attendance by Councillor Hanlon 

NLOWE 2013 Annual Conference 

April 17 and 18, 2013 -  Hotel Gander   

 

  

 

    

Council approval is requested for Councillor Hanlon to  attend the  above  noted event. 

  

   

 

 

 

 

Neil A. Martin 

Deputy City Manager/Director of 

Corporate Services & City Clerk 

 

 

  







ECONOMIC INDICATORS

• The New Housing Price Index for St. John’s Metro was 148 in  
  January 2013 up 1.2%*

• The Consumer Price Index for St. John’s Metro was 123.4 in 
  January 2013 up 0.8%* 

• Retail sales (seasonally adjusted) for Newfoundland and 
  Labrador were $680 million in January 2013 up 2.8%*

*  same month in the previous year.

LABOUR FORCE CHARACTERISTICS
St. John’s Metro, (seasonally adjusted, three-month moving 
average)

Feb 13 Chg.*

Labour Force             116,400 -0.1%
Unemployment Rate 7.0% -0.6pt
Employment  Rate                70.7%                  -1.3pt
Participation  Rate                70.7% -1.3 pt

ECONOMIC UPDATE
APRIL 2013

Contact us at business@stjohns.ca to be 
added to our monthly distribution list

BUSINESS BRIEFS
Newfoundland and Labrador was the only Canadian province to 
post stronger business sector labour productivity growth than the 
United States between 1998 and 2011, according to the Conference 
Board of Canada.  The primary reason behind this productivity was 
a structural shift in Newfoundland and Labrador’s economy where 
an oil boom increased the contribution of the highly productive 
mineral fuels industry from an estimated 1.5 per cent of real GDP in 
1997 to 19.4 per cent in 2011.   

Entrepreneurs across Canada are invited to submit their big-
gest business challenge for the opportunity to win a $100,000 
grant from TELUS.  Entries will be judged by a panel that 
includes entrepreneurs and business experts. For full details 
about how to enter and to read the contest rules and regula-
tions, please visit Globeandmail.com/thechallenge.

In January, the number of people receiving regular Employment 
Insurance (EI) benefits decreased by 20.4 per cent to 3,560, com-
pared with January 2012, in the St. John’s Census Metropolitan 
Area (CMA).   There were 910 fewer beneficiaries in the St. John’s 
CMA in January 2013 compared to the previous January, according 
to Statistics Canada.

Average weekly earnings have increased 34 per cent since 
2007 in the St. John’s CMA, the highest growth rate in Cana-
da, according to Statistics Canada (CANSIM).  In December 
2007 average weekly earnings were $753 in the St. John’s 
CMA compared to $948 in December 2012.



ECONOMIC UPDATE     APRIL 2013

Business Approvals

Atlantic Auto Sales
261 Kenmount Rd.

Supplement King
350 Torbay Rd.

Golf Town
50 White Rose Dr.

Quilts Etc.
Avalon Mall

New Home 
Based Business

Preparing and delivery 
cooked meals

191 Topsail Rd.

Office for non-profit 
coordinator

260 Hamilton Ave.

Hair Salon
5 Lewsiporte Pl.

Kimspirations! 
wedding planning

25 Brad Gushue Cres.

Internet Marketing
29A Point Leamington St.

Mural painting business 
12A Sinnot Pl.

City Building Permits (Year to date as of March 25, 2013) 
Type 2012 2013 % Variance
Commercial $19,700,400 $33,000,600 68
Industrial $1,300,100 $25,000 -98
Institutional $8,600,900 $6,800,100 -21
Residential $25,100,400 $19,200,600 -24
Repairs $600,800 $500,100 -17
Total $55,302,600 $59,526,400 8

Upcoming Events
Opportunities in India Info Session	 Apr 8    e-mail: kday@gov.nl.ca

Canada Business Guest Advisor (free): Legal 
Consultation

Apr 8 e-mail: info.cb.nl@acoa-apeca.gc.ca

Canada Business Guest Advisor (free): 
Accounting

Apr 9 e-mail: info.cb.nl@acoa-apeca.gc.ca

Board of Trade luncheon with Bernard Lord, 
CWTA President & CEO

Apr 10 www.bot.nf.ca 

Canada Business Guest Advisor (free):  
HR strategies

Apr 10	 e-mail: info.cb.nl@acoa-apeca.gc.ca

Arctic Oil & Gas North America Apr 10-11 www.ibcenergy.com/arcticnorthamerica
Canada Business Guest Advisor (free): 
Digital Marketing  

Apr 11	 e-mail: info.cb.nl@acoa-apeca.gc.ca

First Time Skills for Supervisors & Managers Apr 15	 www.ctrcanada.com

Board of Trade Lunch n’ Learn Making 
Conflict Resolution Easy

Apr 16 www.bot.nf.ca

St. John’s Regional Transportation Summit Apr 25	 www.northeastavalonredb.ca
Adapting to Change: Managing the Transition Apr 25	 www.mun.ca/gardinercentre
Sci-fi on the Rock Apr 26-27 www.scifiontherock.com

City Initiatives

Let’s Recognize our Best in Tourism

The City of St. John’s is calling for nominations for its 22nd annual Tourism Awards. Each year 
the City presents a number of awards to the best in the tourism industry. The City will present a 
new award in 2013, the Discovery Award. This new award acknowledges the important contribu-
tion of new and innovative tourism-related products, services, or activities which enhance the St. 
John’s tourism industry. Nominations close 4:30 p.m. Wednesday, April 10, 2013. Both the nomi-
nation form and awards criteria can be found under news releases on the City’s website 
www.stjohns.ca.  

348 Water Street
City of St. John’s, P.O. Box 908
St. John’s, NL A1C 5M2
(709) 576-8107
business@stjohns.ca
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