
 

AGENDA 
REGULAR MEETING 

 
January 14, 2019 

4:30 p.m. 
 



MEMORANDUM 

January 11, 2019 

In accordance with Section 42 of the City of St. John’s Act, the Regular Meeting of the St. 
John’s Municipal Council will be held on Monday, January 14, 2019 at 4:30 p.m. 

By Order 

Elaine Henley 
City Clerk 



AGENDA 
REGULAR MEETING - CITY COUNCIL 
January 14, 2019 – 4:30 p.m. – Council Chamber, 4th Floor, City Hall 

 
1.  CALL TO ORDER 

 
2.  PROCLAMATIONS/PRESENTATIONS 

 
3.  APPROVAL OF THE AGENDA 

 
4.  ADOPTION OF THE MINUTES  

 
 Minutes of January 7, 2019 

 
5.  BUSINESS ARISING FROM THE MINUTES 

 
a. Decision Note dated January 4, 2019 re: Text Amendment to add Vehicle 

Storage Yard as a Discretionary Use in the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone, 
REZ1800017, 18 International Place, Applicant WLH Holdings Ltd. 

 
b. Decision Note dated January 8, 2019 re: St. John’s Municipal Plan Amendment 

Number 151, 2018 and St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment 
Number 688, 2018; Text Amendment to Enable Distillery as a Discretionary Use; 
MPA1800008; 140 Harbour Drive; Applicant: Project Peat Inc./Wooden Walls 
Distilling. 

 
6.  NOTICES PUBLISHED 

 
a. In conjunction with a rezoning application, a Discretionary Use is requested for 

the development of a Vehicle Storage Yard at 18 International Place. The 
proposed site is 5 acres (20,234 m2) and would be used to store up to 200+ 
vehicles for a rental car company. The entire site would be enclosed with an 
eight-foot-high fence. 
 

7.  PUBLIC HEARINGS/MEETINGS 
 
8.  COMMITTEE REPORTS 

 
a. Development Committee Report – January 8, 2019 
 

9.  RESOLUTIONS 
 
10.  DEVELOPMENT PERMITS LIST    

 
11.  BUILDING PERMITS LIST 

 
 Building Permits List – January 1 – 10, 2019 

 
 
 



12.  REQUISITIONS, PAYROLLS AND ACCOUNTS  
 

 Payroll and Accounts – Week Ending January 9, 2019 
 
13.  TENDERS/RFPS 

 
a. Bid Approval Note # 2018166: Supply of Polymer 

 
b. Bid Approval Note # 2018231: Supply of Antifreeze, Windshield Wash, 

and Diesel Exhaust Fluid 
 

c. Bid Approval Note # 2018261:  Food Service Provider for Senior’s 
Outreach Program 

 
d. Bid Approval Note # 2018266: Miscellaneous Truck and Trailer Parts 

 
e. Bid Approval Note # 2018270: Snow Clearing & Ice Control – Elizabeth 

Avenue & Area Sidewalks 
 

14.  NOTICES OF MOTION, RESOLUTIONS QUESTIONS AND PETITIONS 
 

15.  OTHER BUSINESS 
 

a. Economic Update – January 2019 
 
16.  ADJOURNMENT 

 



 
The background information detailed in these minutes can be found in the corresponding Agenda 

 

MINUTES 
REGULAR MEETING - CITY COUNCIL 
January 7, 2019 – 4:30 p.m. – Foran/Greene Room, 4th Floor, City Hall 

 
 

Present Mayor Danny Breen 
 Councillor Maggie Burton 

Councillor Dave Lane 
Councillor Sandy Hickman 
Councillor Debbie Hanlon 
Councillor Deanne Stapleton 
Councillor Hope Jamieson  
Councillor Jamie Korab 

 Councillor Ian Froude 
 Councillor Wally Collins 
 
Regrets Deputy Mayor O’Leary  
 
Others Kevin Breen, City Manager 

Derek Coffey, Deputy City Manager of Finance & Administration 
Tanya Haywood, Deputy City Manager, Community Services  
Jason Sinyard, Deputy City Manager, Planning, Engineering & Regulatory 

Services 
Lynnann Winsor, Deputy City Manager, Public Works 
Cheryl Mullett, City Solicitor 
Ken O’Brien, Chief Municipal Planner  
Elaine Henley, City Clerk  
Karen Chafe, Supervisor – Office of the City Clerk 

 
Land Acknowledgement 
Mayor Breen read the following statement: 
 
“We respectfully acknowledge the Province of Newfoundland & Labrador, of which the City of St. John’s is 
the capital City, as the ancestral homelands of the Beothuk. Today, these lands are home to a diverse 
population of indigenous and other peoples. We would also like to acknowledge with respect the diverse 
histories and cultures of the Mi’kmaq, Innu, Inuit, and Southern Inuit of this Province.” 
 
CALL TO ORDER/ADOPTION OF AGENDA

 
SJMC2019-01-07/001R  
Moved – Councillor Jamieson; Seconded – Councillor Hanlon 
 

That the agenda be adopted as presented. 
CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

 
ADOPTION OF MINUTES 

 
SJMC2019-01-07/002R  
Moved – Councillor Collins; Seconded – Councillor Stapleton 
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That the minutes of December 17, 2018 be adopted as presented. 

CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

NOTICES PUBLISHED  
 
Change of Non-Conforming Use Application – 95 Merrymeeting Road – Residential 
Medium Density (R2) Zone 
 
A change of non-conforming use application has been submitted by Laundry Services 
NL requesting permission to change the occupancy of 95 Merrymeeting Road to a 
Laundromat. Hours of operation will be seven days a week 8 a.m. - 9 p.m. The business 
will occupy the entire building with a floor area of approximately 167 m2 and employ 8-10 
employees with no more than 4 per shift. One (1) submission received. 

 
SJMC2019-01-07/003R  
Moved – Councillor Burton; Seconded – Councillor Hickman 
 
That Council approve the above-noted application subject to all applicable 
City requirements. 

 CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

Discretionary Use Application – 2 Stead Place – Residential Low Density (R1) Zone 
 
A Discretionary Use application has been submitted requesting an expansion to the 
Discovery Days Children’s Day Care Centre at 2 Stead Place. The proposed expansion 
will include both unused existing space in the building, as well as an extension to the 
building itself. The existing day care centre occupies a floor area of 138.2m2. An 
additional 80.4m2 of day care space is proposed including a 3.53m x 12.38m 
(43.7m2) extension to the rear of the building plus a 36.7m2 expansion into unused space 
within the building, for a total daycare floor area of 219m2. Onsite 
parking is available.  One (1) submission received.  

SJMC2019-01-07/004R  
Moved – Councillor Burton; Seconded – Councillor Collins 
 
That Council approve the above-noted application subject to all applicable 
City requirements. 

 CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

Discretionary Use Application – 31 Doyle’s Road  – Residential Low Density (R1) 
Zone 
 
A Discretionary Use application has been made by Creative Discovery Children’s Center 
for an expansion to the existing Daycare at 31 Doyle’s Road. The proposed expansion 
will include both unused existing space in the building, as well as an extension 
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to the building itself. The existing daycare occupies a floor area of 160 m2. An additional 
extension of 114 m2 of day care space is proposed including renovations 
in the existing basement of 63.3 m2 for a new total school area of 309.3 m2. On-site 
parking is available. One (1) submission received. 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/005R  
Moved – Councillor Burton; Seconded – Councillor Hanlon  
 
That Council approve the above-noted application subject to all applicable 
City requirements. 
 
SJMC2019-01-07/006R  
Moved – Councillor Collins; Seconded – Councillor Burton  
 
That the motion be amended so that Council approves the above-noted 
application subject to all applicable City requirements as well as the 
installation of a privacy fence on the property. 
 

CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY AS AMENDED 
 

COMMITTEE REPORTS  
 

Committee of the Whole Report – December 19, 2018 

1. Environmental Advisory Committee Report – December 4, 2018 
 

a. Committee Membership – Climate Change Expertise 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/007R  
Moved – Councillor Froude; Seconded – Councillor Lane 

 
That Council authorize the recruitment of a climate change adaptation 
and mitigation expert for inclusion on the Environmental Advisory 
Committee. 

 
CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

 
2. Decision Note dated December 4, 2018 re:  Revision of Low Cost Spay/Neuter 

Program 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/008R  
Moved – Councillor Korab; Seconded – Councillor Jamieson 

 
To approve the implementation of new program combining in house spays 
with private veterinary clinic neutering of cats.  Applications to start 
January 2019. 
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 Males outsourced at a new fee of $135.00 
 Females spayed in house at a new fee of $140.00 
 Same number of female surgeries to be performed as in previous years 

 
CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

 
Development Committee Report – December 18, 2018 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/009R  
Moved – Councillor Burton; Seconded – Councillor Hanlon 

 
That the recommendation of the Development Committee to approve the 
parking relief for the proposed Daycare Centre expansion at 2 Stead Place 
be approved. 

CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 
 
DEVELOPMENT PERMITS LIST 

 
Council considered, for information, the Development Permits List for the period December 
6, 2018 to December 13, 2018. 
 
BUILDING PERMITS LIST  

 
Council considered the above noted for the period of December 13, 2018 to December 
31, 2019 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/010R  
Moved – Councillor Hanlon; Seconded – Councillor Jamieson 
 
That Council approve the above cited building permits list as presented. 

 
 CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 

REQUISITIONS, PAYROLLS AND ACCOUNTS
 

Council considered the requisitions, payrolls and accounts for the weeks ending December 
19, 2018 and January 3, 2019 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/011R  
Moved – Councillor Hanlon ; Seconded – Councillor Jamieson 
 
That the requisitions, payrolls and accounts for the week ending December 
19, 2018 in the amount of $3,582.197.78 and the week ending January 3, 2019 
in the amount of $5,225,243.28 be approved as presented. 
 

     CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 
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OTHER BUSINESS
 
Decision Note dated December 12, 2018 re: Appointment to Youth Advisory Committee 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/012R  
Moved – Councillor Burton; Seconded – Councillor Lane 
  
That Council approve the appointment of Heather Roberts representing 
Choices for Youth to the Youth Advisory Committee in accordance with 
Section 3.1.1 of the Terms of Reference. 
 

     CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 
 
Decision Note dated December 20, 2018 re: Appointment to Affordable Housing Working 
Group 
 

SJMC2019-01-07/013R  
Moved – Councillor Jamieson; Seconded – Councillor Stapleton 
  
That Council accept Grayson Kelly as the Newfoundland and Labrador 
Housing Corporation representative on the Affordable Housing Working 
Group. 

     CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY 
 
Sidewalk Parking on Craigmillar Avenue 
 
Councillor Korab referenced the above and asked Council to reconsider its recent ban on 
the parking of cars in a perpendicular manner on sidewalks on Craigmillar Avenue during 
the winter.  Residents are having great difficulty with the clearing of snow which has 
been made more difficult with the discontinuance of this practice.  
 
ADJOURNMENT 

 
There being no further business, the meeting adjourned at 4:55 p.m.  
 
 
         

________________________ 
            MAYOR 
 
 
        ________________________ 
         CITY CLERK 



 

 

 

 
City of St. John’s  PO Box 908  St. John’s, NL  Canada  A1C 5M2  www.stjohns.ca 

 
Title:  Text Amendment to add Vehicle Storage Yard as a Discretionary Use in the 

Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone  
REZ1800017 
18 International Place 
Applicant: WLH Holdings Ltd. 
 

Date Prepared:   January 4, 2019 
 
Report To:    His Worship the Mayor and Members of Council 
 
Councillor & Role:  Councillor Maggie Burton, Planning and Development Lead 
 
Ward:     1   
 
Decision/Direction Required:  
That Council adopt the attached resolution for St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment Number 
691, 2019.  
 
Discussion – Background and Current Status: 
The City received an application to allow a Vehicle Storage Yard at 18 International Place. To consider this 
application, a text amendment to the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone is proposed, which would add Vehicle 
Storage Yard as a Discretionary Use. An amendment to the St. John’s Municipal Plan is not required. 
  
The proposed property is currently undeveloped, vacant land, with access from International Place and 
frontage on Portugal Cove Road. The site is bound to the south by the headwaters of Virginia River and is 
highly visible from portions of Portugal Cove Road (heading toward the airport) and the Outer Ring Road. 
The 5-acre (20,234 m2) site is proposed to have a gravel parking surface and be used to store up to 200+ 
vehicles in a "stacked parking" fashion (similar to a car dealership’s excess storage) for a rental car company. 
The entire site would be enclosed with an eight-foot-high fence, topped with barbed wire, while a manually 
operated gate would control access to/from the site. The site would be accessible by authorized personnel 
who are delivering or removing vehicles as needed.   
 
The proposed amendment was advertised on three occasions in The Telegram newspaper and was posted on 
the City’s website. No submissions were received by the City Clerk.  
 
Key Considerations/Implications: 
 

1. Budget/Financial Implications: Not applicable. 
 

2. Partners or Other Stakeholders:  
Neighbouring property owners.    

 
3. Alignment with Strategic Directions/Adopted Plans:   

A City for All Seasons – Support year-round industry activity.  
 
 

DECISION/DIRECTION NOTE



Decision/Direction Note  Page 2 
18 International Place 
 

4. Legal or Policy Implications:   
A text amendment to the St. John’s Development Regulations is required to add Vehicle Storage 
Yard to the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone as a Discretionary Use. 
 

5. Engagement and Communications Considerations: 
Public notice of the proposed amendment.  
 

6. Human Resource Implications: Not applicable. 
 

7. Procurement Implications: Not applicable. 
 

8. Information Technology Implications: Not applicable. 
 

9. Other Implications: Not applicable. 
 
Recommendation: 
It is recommended that Council adopt St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment Number 691, 2019, 
which considers a proposed text amendment to the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone by adding Vehicle 
Storage Yard as a Discretionary Use. If the proposed amendment is adopted by Council, it will then be 
referred to the Department of Municipal Affairs and Environment with a request for Provincial Registration 
in accordance with the provisions of the Urban and Rural Planning Act.   
 
As part of the approval process, it is also recommended that Council approve the Discretionary Use of 18 
International Place for a Vehicle Storage Yard in the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone, as advertised subject 
to Section 5.5. 
 
Prepared by/Signature: 
Lindsay Lyghtle Brushett, MCIP, Planner  
 
 
 
Signature: ____________________________________ 
 
Approved by - Date/Signature: 
Ken O’Brien, MCIP, Chief Municipal Planner  
 
 
 
Signature: ____________________________________ 
 
LLB/dlm 
 
Attachments:  Zoning Map  

Resolution 
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RESOLUTION 

ST. JOHN’S DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS 
AMENDMENT NUMBER 691, 2019 

 
WHEREAS the City of St. John’s wishes to allow a Vehicle Storage Yard as a Discretionary Use in 
the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone. 
 
BE IT THEREFORE RESOLVED that the City of St. John’s hereby adopts the following text 
amendment to the St. John’s Development Regulations in accordance with the provisions of the 
Urban and Rural Planning Act: 
 

1) Add Section 10.27.2 Discretionary Uses: 
 

“(l) Vehicle Storage Yard” 
 

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City of St. John’s requests the Minister of Municipal 
Affairs and Environment to register the proposed amendment in accordance with the requirements of 
the Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000. 
 
IN WITNESS THEREOF the Seal of the City of St. John’s has been hereunto affixed and this 
Resolution has been signed by the Mayor and the City Clerk on behalf of Council this ___ day of 
_______________, 2019. 
 
 
 
 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Mayor       MCIP 

 I hereby certify that this Amendment has been prepared in 
 accordance with the Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000. 

 
 
______________________________                                                     
City Clerk 
 
 
 
 
             
Council Adoption     Provincial Registration 
 



 

 

 

City of St. John’s  PO Box 908  St. John’s, NL  Canada  A1C 5M2  www.stjohns.ca 

 
 
Title: St. John’s Municipal Plan Amendment Number 151, 2018 and 

St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment Number 688, 2018 
Text Amendment to Enable Distillery as a Discretionary Use 
MPA1800008 
140 Harbour Drive 
Applicant: Project Peat Inc./Wooden Walls Distilling 

 
Date Prepared:   January 8, 2019 
 
Report To:     His Worship the Mayor and Members of Council  
 
Councillor & Role:  Councillor Maggie Burton, Planning and Development Lead 
 
Ward:     2 
 
Decision/Direction Required:  
Following Provincial release of the proposed amendment for 140 Harbour Drive, Council may proceed and adopt 
St. John’s Municipal Plan Amendment Number 151, 2018, and St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment 
Number 688, 2018.    
 
Discussion – Background and Current Status:  
The City has received an application for a distillery at 140 Harbour Drive (former Templeton’s paint store). The 
property is zoned Commercial Central Retail – Water Street West (CCR- Water Street West) which does not 
permit a Distillery. Amendments to the St. John’s Municipal Plan and Development Regulations are required to 
add Craft Brewery/Distillery as a definition and to set conditions around the use. The intent of the amendment is 
to allow small-scale facilities to produce onsite, to include a tasting room, and to consider other associated uses, 
such as a restaurant or small-scale retail. 
 
The property is designated in the Commercial Downtown District under the St. John’s Municipal Plan. Distillery 
is not included in Section 3.3.4 of the Municipal Plan and therefore an amendment to the Municipal Plan is 
required.  
 
Once a definition for Craft Brewery/Distillery is added to the Development Regulations, additions to a number of 
other zones are required in order to recognize existing craft breweries such as Yellowbelly Brewery, the new 
brewpub being developed at 90 Duckworth Street, and Quidi Vidi Brewery. It is also recommended to include the 
use in other appropriate commercial and industrial zones. This includes adding Craft Brewery/Distillery as a 
permitted use in the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone and the Industrial General (IG) Zone and as a discretionary 
use in the Industrial Quidi Vidi (IQ) Zone, the Commercial Central Mixed Use (CCM) Zone, the Commercial 
Central Retail (CCR) Zone, the Commercial Highway (CH) Zone, the Commercial Mixed Use (CM) Zone, and 
the Commercial Regional (CR) Zone. The discretionary uses in the CCR-Water Street West Zone include all uses 
referenced in the CCR Zone, therefore by adding Craft Brewery/Distillery as a discretionary use in the CCR Zone, 
it will also be included in the CCR- Water Street West Zone.  
 
At its Regular Meeting on December 17, 2018, Council decided to proceed with the proposed amendments and 
requested that the Department of Municipal Affairs and Environment issue a Provincial release for the 
amendments. Provincial release has now been issued for St. John’s Municipal Plan Amendment Number 151, 

DECISION/DIRECTION NOTE



Decision/Direction Note  Page 2 
140 Harbour Drive 
 
2018 and St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment Number 688, 2018. It is now in order for Council to 
proceed with the next steps in the amendment process. 
 
Key Considerations/Implications: 
 

1. Budget/Financial Implications: Not applicable. 
 

2. Partners or Other Stakeholders:  
Neighbouring residents and property owners.    

 
3. Alignment with Strategic Directions/Adopted Plans:  

Neighbourhoods Build our City – Maintain and position downtown as a distinct neighbourhood.  
 

4. Legal or Policy Implications:  
A text amendment to the St. John’s Municipal Plan and Development Regulations is required.  

 
5. Engagement and Communications Considerations: 

A Public Hearing chaired by an independent commissioner is required.  
 

6. Human Resource Implications: Not applicable. 
 

7. Procurement Implications: Not applicable. 
 

8. Information Technology Implications: Not applicable. 
 

9. Other Implications: Not applicable. 
 
Recommendation:  
It is recommended that Council now adopt the attached resolutions for St. John’s Municipal Plan Amendment 
Number 151, 2018 and St. John’s Development Regulations Amendment Number 688, 2018. If the resolutions are 
adopted by Council, it is further recommended that Council appoint Mr. Cliff Johnston, MCIP, a member of the 
City’s commissioner list, to conduct a public hearing on the proposed amendments. The proposed date for the 
public hearing is Thursday, February 7, 2019, at 7pm at St. John’s City Hall. 
 
Prepared by/Signature: 
Ann-Marie Cashin, MCIP – Planner III, Urban Design and Heritage 
 
 
Signature:    
 
Approved by/Date/Signature: 
Ken O’Brien, MCIP – Chief Municipal Planner 
 
 
Signature:    
 
AMC/dlm 
 
Attachments:  
Amendments 
Location map 
Site Plan and Floor Plan  
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RESOLUTION 
ST. JOHN’S MUNICIPAL PLAN 

AMENDMENT NUMBER 151, 2018 
 

WHEREAS the City of St. John’s wishes to accommodate Craft Brewery/Distillery as a land use 
that could be considered in the Commercial General, Commercial Highway and Commercial 
Downtown Land Use Districts.  

 

BE IT THEREFORE RESOLVED that the City of St. John’s hereby adopts the following text 
amendments to the St. John’s Municipal Plan in accordance with the provisions of the Urban and 
Rural Planning Act. 

 

1. Amend Section 3.3.2 General - Commercial, Conditional Zones by adding: 
“8. Craft Brewery/Distillery” 
 

2. Amend Section 3.3.3 Commercial – Highway, Conditional Zones by adding: 
“4. Craft Brewery/Distillery” 
 

3. Amend Section 3.3.4 Commercial – Downtown, Conditional Zones by adding: 
“8. Craft Brewery/Distillery” 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City of St. John’s requests the Minister of Municipal 
Affairs and Environment to register the proposed amendment in accordance with the 
requirements of the Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000. 

 

IN WITNESS THEREOF the Seal of the City of St. John’s has been hereunto affixed and this 
Resolution has been signed by the Mayor and the City Clerk on behalf of Council this 

____ day of _________________, 2019. 

 
 
 
 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Mayor       MCIP 

I hereby certify that this Amendment has been 
prepared in accordance with the Urban and Rural 
Planning Act, 2000. 

 
______________________________                                                     
City Clerk 
 
 
 
                         
Council Adoption     Provincial Registration 
 



RESOLUTION 
ST. JOHN’S DEVELOPMENT REGULATIONS 

AMENDMENT NUMBER 688, 2018 
 

WHEREAS the City of St. John’s wishes to allow a Craft Brewery/Distillery as a Permitted Use 
in the Commercial Industrial (CI) Zone, the Industrial General (IG) Zone and the Industrial Quidi 
Vidi (IQ) Zone, and as a Discretionary Use in the Commercial Central Mixed Use (CCM) Zone, 
the Commercial Central Retail (CCR) Zone, the Commercial Highway (CH) Zone, the Commercial 
Mixed Use (CM) Zone, and the Commercial Regional (CR) Zone. 

 

BE IT THEREFORE RESOLVED that the City of St. John’s hereby adopts the following text 
amendments to the St. John’s Development Regulations in accordance with the provisions of the 
Urban and Rural Planning Act: 
 

1) Add Section 2 Definitions:  
“CRAFT BREWERY/DISTILLERY means a facility which is licensed by the 
Province to produce, sell and distribute beer, wine, or other liquor or distilled spirits 
and shall include a tasting room open to the public. Retail sales or Restaurant may be 
permitted.  

 
2) Amend Section 7 Special Developments to add: 

“7.34 CRAFT BREWERY/DISTILLERY 
Craft Brewery/Distillery shall: 

(a) Have all processing and storage contained within a building, except in an 
industrial zone, and 

(b) The area dedicated to production and storage shall not exceed 500 m2.” 
 

3) Add Section 10.20.2 Discretionary Uses: 
“(g) Craft Brewery/Distillery” 

 
4) Add Section 10.21.2 Discretionary Uses: 

“(f) Craft Brewery/Distillery” 
 

5) Add Section 10.22.2 Discretionary Uses: 
“(i) Craft Brewery/Distillery” 

 
6) Add Section 10.23.2 Discretionary Uses: 

“(h) Craft Brewery/Distillery” 
 

7) Add Section 10.25.2 Discretionary Uses: 
“(d) Craft Brewery/Distillery” 

 
8) Add Section 10.27.1 Permitted Uses, Industrial: 

“(bb) Craft Brewery/Distillery” and renumber remaining uses.  
 

  



 
9) Add Section 10.28.1 Permitted Uses, Industrial: 

“(g) Craft Brewery/Distillery” and renumber remaining uses.  
 

10) Add Section 10.29.2 Discretionary Uses, Industrial: 
“(f) Craft Brewery/Distillery”  
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City of St. John’s requests the Minister of Municipal 
Affairs and Environment to register the proposed amendment in accordance with the requirements 
of the Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000. 
 
IN WITNESS THEREOF the Seal of the City of St. John’s has been hereunto affixed and this 
Resolution has been signed by the Mayor and the City Clerk on behalf of Council this ___ day of 
_______________, 2019. 

 
 
 
 
 
______________________________   ______________________________ 
Mayor       MCIP 

I hereby certify that this Amendment has 
been prepared in accordance with the 
Urban and Rural Planning Act, 2000. 

 
______________________________                                                     
City Clerk 
 
 
 
             
Council Adoption     Provincial Registration 
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NOTICES PUBLISHED 
 
 

 

Applications which have been advertised in accordance with the requirements of Section 5.5 of the St. John's Development Regulations and which are to be considered 
for approval by Council at the Regular Meeting of Council on January 14, 2019. 
 
 
 

Ref 
# 

Property Location/ 
Zone Designation Ward Application Details 

Floor Area
(square 
metres) 

# of 
Employees
(includes the 

applicant) 

# of 
On-Site 
Parking
Spaces

Written 
Representation

s Received 

Planning and Development 
Division Notes�

 
1 

 
18 International Place 
Commercial Industrial  

(CI) Zone 

 
1 

 
In conjunction with a rezoning application, a 
Discretionary Use is requested for the development of 
a Vehicle Storage Yard at 18 International Place. The 
proposed site is 5 acres (20,234 m2) and would be 
used to store up to 200+ vehicles for a rental car 
company. The entire site would be enclosed with an 
eight-foot-high fence. 
 

    
No 

Submission
Received 

 

 
The Planning and 

Development Division 
recommends approval of 
the application subject to 

the rezoning approval 
and all applicable City 

requirements 

 
 
The Office of the City Clerk and the Department of Planning, Engineering and Regulatory Services, in joint effort, have sent written notification of the applications to property owners and occupants of buildings located within a 
minimum 150-metre radius of the application sites.  Applications have also been advertised in The Telegram newspaper on at least one occasion and applications are also posted on the City's website.  Where written representations 
on an application have been received by the City Clerk’s Department, these representations have been included in the agenda for the Regular Meeting of Council.  

   
G:\Planning and Development\Planning\ARCHIVED-NoticesPublishedLists\2019\02 - January 14 2019.docx 

    

Jason Sinyard, P. Eng, MBA 
Deputy City Manager, Planning, Engineering and Regulatory Services 
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REPORT TO COUNCIL 
DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE MEETING  
January 8, 2019 – 10:00 a.m. – Conference Room A, 4th Floor, City Hall 

 
 

1. 2656 Trans Canada Highway 
Crown Land Grant – Heavy Equipment Storage 

 
 

Recommendation 
 
That the Crown Land Grant application be approved subject to the following 
conditions: 

 submission of a development application and plans for the site prior to 
final developmental approval;   

 the proposed storage yard must not encroach within 15 meters of the 
high-water mark of Torbayman’s Pond. 

 
 

2. Crown Land Permission to Construct a Sign 
1037 Blackhead Road 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the application to approve the construction of a sign at 1037 Blackhead 
Road be approved. 
 
 

 
Jason Sinyard 
Deputy City Manager – Planning, Engineering & Regulatory Services 
Chairperson 
 
 

 
 

















Building Permits List 

Council’s January 14, 2019 Regular Meeting 

 
 Permits Issued:  2019/01/01 to 2019/01/10 

 Class: Commercial 

 5 Job St, Suite 201                   Co   Office 

 655 Topsail Rd, Unit 703              Co   Retail Store 

 Avalon Mall - Rec Room                Sn   Retail Store 

 204 Freshwater Rd                     Sn   Pharmacy 

 261 Kenmount Rd                       Sn   Office 

 323 Kenmount Rd                       Sn   Retail Store 

 20 Peet St                            Ms   Car Sales Lot 

 430 Topsail Rd, Hakim Optical         Sn   Service Shop 

 220 Waterford Bridge Rd               Sn   Home For Aged 

 55 White Rose Dr, Suite 201           Sn   Clinic 

 178 Water St, Bad Bones               Cr   Restaurant 

 240 Waterford Bridge Rd 2nd Fl        Cr   Office 

 21 Queen's Rd                         Rn   Mixed Use 

 122 Terra Nova Rd                     Rn   Condominium 

 279 Duckworth St                      Rn   Office 

 46a Aberdeen Ave                      Rn   Restaurant 

 541 Kenmount Rd                       Rn   Office 

 354 Water St                          Rn   Mixed Use 

 This Week $    630,400.00 

 Class: Industrial 

 This Week $           .00 

 Class: Government/Institutional 

 This Week $           .00 

 Class: Residential 

 24 Lilac Cres, Lot 99                 Nc   Duplex Dwelling 

 26 Lilac Cres, Lot 98                 Nc   Duplex Dwelling 

 225 Blackmarsh Rd, Unit 113           Rn   Apartment Building 

 2 Boulevard                           Rn   Apartment Building 

 9 Canso Pl                            Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 

 3 Hyde Park Dr                        Rn   Single Detached Dwelling 

 42 Livingstone St                     Rn   Townhousing 

 22 Nascopie Cres                      Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 

 122 Terra Nova Rd, Unit 107           Rn   Condominium 

 122 Terra Nova Rd, Unit 207           Rn   Condominium 

 11 Wood St                            Rn   Semi-Detached Dwelling 

 This Week $    541,500.00 

 Class: Demolition 

 This Week $           .00 

  This Week's Total: $  1,171,900.00 



     Repair Permits Issued:  2019/01/01 To 2019/01/10 $     32,500.00 

 Legend 

 Co  Change Of Occupancy        Sw  Site Work 

 Cr  Chng Of Occ/Renovtns       Ms  Mobile Sign 

 Ex  Extension                  Sn  Sign 

 Nc  New Construction           Cc  Chimney Construction 

 Oc  Occupant Change            Dm  Demolition 

 Rn  Renovations 
 

YEAR TO DATE COMPARISONS

TYPE 2018 2019 % VARIANCE (+/-)

Commercial $217,200.00 $630,400.00 190

Industrial $0.00 $0.00 0

Government/Institutional $2,000,000.00 $0.00 -100

Residential $4,960,867.00 $541,500.00 -89

Repairs $32,000.00 $32,500.00 2

Housing Units(1 & 2 Family 

Dwelling 2 2

TOTAL $7,210,067.00 $1,204,400.00 -83

January 14, 2019

 
 

 

 

 

 

Respectfully Submitted, 

 

 

 

 

 

Jason Sinyard, P. Eng., MBA 

Deputy City Manager 

Planning, Engineering & Regulatory Services 



   

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Weekly Payment Vouchers 
For The 

Week Ending January 9, 2019 
 

 
 
 
Payroll 
 
 
Public Works $     675,483.17 
 
Bi-Weekly Administration $     807,661.60 
 
Bi-Weekly Management  $     844,320.49 
 
Bi-Weekly Fire Department $     908,175.65 
 
 
Accounts Payable                                                       $   8,454,450.88 
 
 
 

 
 
 
                                              Total:            $  11,690,091.79 
 





















Item Description Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

ANTIFREEZE DIESEL RED 

'PERMANENT TYPE'  4-L 

NO PREMIX

9.33$          $ 14,386.86 $ 12.9300 $ 19,938.06 17.10$           $ 26,368.20 16.99$        $ 26,198.58 15.00$           $ 23,130.00 $ 17.7100 $ 27,308.82 10.65$              $ 16,422.30 15.38$           $ 23,715.96

ANTIFREEZE GAS LINE 

150ML

1.00$          $ 23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.59$          $ 36.57 0.99$             $ 22.77 1.20$                 $ 27.60 1.05$             $ 24.15

ANTIFREEZE DIESEL 4L 

(GREEN) NO PREMIX

13.63$        $ 1,485.67 $ 12.3800 $ 1,349.42 14.60$           $ 1,591.40 14.99$        $ 1,633.91 16.50$           $ 1,798.50 $ 15.6300 $ 1,703.67 14.50$              $ 1,580.50 12.69$           $ 1,383.21

WASH WINDSHIELD 4L 3.55$          $ 4,217.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.79$          $ 5,690.52 4.49$             $ 5,334.12 $ 2.9500 $ 3,504.60 3.89$                 $ 4,621.32 3.89$             $ 4,621.32

FLUID DIESEL EXHAUST 

DEF 2 1/2 GAL TERA 

CLEAR

9.99$          $ 1,198.80 No Bid No Bid 10.50$           $ 1,260.00 No Bid No Bid 10.75$           1,290.00$          $ 11.8800 $ 1,425.60 11.25$              $ 1,350.00 13.75$           $ 1,650.00

WASH WINDSHIELD (-

40)TOTE APPROX 1000L

765.00$     $ 9,945.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,335.50$         $ 17,361.50 No Bid No Bid

CORE CHARGE FOR 

WASH WINDSHIELD (-

40)TOTE APPROX 1000L

150.00$     $ 1,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FLUID DIESEL EXHAUST 

TOTE APPROX 1000L

815.00$     $ 8,965.00 No Bid No Bid 1,000.00$     $ 11,000.00 No Bid No Bid 1,100.00$     12,100.00$        No Bid No Bid 956.00$            $ 10,516.00 No Bid No Bid

CORE CHARE FOR FLUID 

DIESEL EXHAUST TOTE 

APPROX 1000L

300.00$     $ 3,300.00 No Bid No Bid 300.00$         $ 3,300.00 No Bid No Bid 200.00$         2,200.00$          No Bid No Bid 250.00$            $ 2,750.00 No Bid No Bid

Parts for Trucks Automotive SuppliesOMB Parts Nappa Auto sales Speedy AutomotiveReefer Repairtraction 506 S&S Supply







Item Item Description unit Manufacture I# Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

103531 VALVE AIR INT'L EA AC008 31 $ 25.0000 $ 775.00

105395 CAMSHAFTLEFT Q-PLUS 

ROCKWELL ONLY

EA 2210W7537 1 $ 32.0000 $ 32.00 $ 35.0000 $ 35.00 No Bid No Bid

105403 CAMSHAFT RIGHT REAR Q-PLUS 

ROCKWELL ONLY

EA 2210V7536 2 $ 32.0000 $ 64.00 $ 35.0000 $ 70.00 No Bid No Bid

107649 SHOE BRAKE FRONT 16.5 X 6 INT'L 

Q-PLUS ROCKWELL ONLY

EA 47152200 27 No Bid No Bid $ 90.5000 $ 2,443.50 No Bid No Bid

107649CC CORE SHOE FRONT ROCKWELL EA XXX 27 No Bid No Bid $ 24.0000 $ 648.00 No Bid No Bid

108738 SHIELD DUST FRONT 

INT'L/FREIGHTLINER MERITOR 

A3264S227

EA A3264S227 6 $ 125.0000 $ 750.00 $ 81.0000 $ 486.00 No Bid No Bid

111138 GASKETHUB WHEEL FRONT CHEV 

OEM#15587580

EA 15587580 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

112631 VALVE AIR BRAKE 2 WAY INT'L 

OEM# 12215

EA 12215 1 $ 47.8500 $ 47.85 $ 24.0600 $ 24.06 No Bid No Bid

113746 CONE SIDE AXLE STUD 5/8" FOR 

SANDERS MERITOR # R005960

EA MERITOR R005960 1 No Bid No Bid $ 35.0000 $ 35.00 No Bid No Bid

115683 SPACER CAMSHAFT INT'L OEM# 

E1113

EA E1113 18 No Bid No Bid $ 2.2500 $ 40.50 No Bid No Bid

117531 VALVE AIR DRYER PURGE KIT 

BENDIX INT'L OEM# 5004341X

EA 5004341X 37 $ 70.0000 $ 2,590.00 $ 72.5000 $ 2,682.50 No Bid No Bid

117531CC CORE VALVE AIR DRYER PURGE 

KIT INT'L

EA XXX 37 $ 22.0000 $ 814.00 $ 22.2700 $ 823.99 No Bid No Bid

117622 HARNESS PURGE VALVE (AIR 

DRYER)  OEM# 109869

EA 109869 4 $ 21.7200 $ 86.88 $ 23.5000 $ 94.00 No Bid No Bid

1257 JOINT U SANDERS R-675X - 1710 EA R-675X 4 $ 35.0700 $ 140.28 $ 68.5000 $ 274.00 $ 70.3900 $ 281.56

1285 SPRING FRONT BRAKE RETURN # 

EUC-E9643 1997 SANDERS

EA E9643 2 $ 13.5400 $ 27.08 $ 10.5000 $ 21.00 No Bid

1348 JOINT U (SPICER #5-677X) EA 5-677X 1 $ 48.9200 $ 48.92 $ 55.0000 $ 55.00 $ 85.1900 $ 85.19

1951 RIM WHEEL BUD TYPE 22.5" EA 28828PW 22 $ 130.0000 $ 2,860.00 $ 199.9500 $ 4,398.90 No Bid

2345 BRACKET MUD FLAP  PART # 415C 

ALL SINGLE AXLE SANDERS

EA 415C 20 No Bid No Bid $ 11.1900 $ 223.80 No Bid No Bid

OMB Parts and Supplies

2018266 Micellaneous truck and Trailer Parts

Reefer Repair harvey & Company



2563 DRUM BRAKE REAR 16.5 x 7  INT'L 

OEM# ZBR3600A

EA ZBR 3600A 94 $ 110.0000 $ 10,340.00 $ 92.5000 $ 8,695.00 No Bid No Bid

2587 YOKE CLEVIS (REAR BR) 

ROCKWELL R810019 TANDEM 

SANDERS

EA R810019 50 $ 19.0000 $ 950.00 $ 13.5000 $ 675.00 No Bid No Bid

2883 GUARD WHEEL BUD WHEELS PT 

ACC5903

EA ACC5903 249 $ 6.5900 $ 1,640.91 $ 5.8600 $ 1,459.14 No Bid No Bid

3021 NUT BUD WHEEL 22MM ALL 

SANDERS / GARBAGE TRUCKS

EA 1649492C2 78 $ 5.6100 $ 437.58 $ 10.2500 $ 799.50 No Bid No Bid

35519 JOINT U CHEV OEM# 2330781 

PT#REPUBLIC #UJ331

EA 2330781 1 $ 37.2400 $ 37.24 $ 13.5000 $ 13.50 No Bid No Bid

3637 INDICATOR WHEEL CHECK (B) 

TRACTION #WLC4-B

EA WLC4-B 366 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3639 INDICATOR WHEEL CHECK (M) 

TRACTION #WLC4-M

EA WLC4-C 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3640 INDICATOR WHEEL CHECK (C) 

TRACTION #WLC4-C

EA WLCH-C 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3955 VALVE PRESSURE PROTECTION 

(BRAKES)

EA 6814290844 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4099 DRUM FRONT 16 1/2 X 6 09 INTL 

7300 UNIT 0909

EA 2501597C1 21 No Bid No Bid $ 215.0000 $ 4,515.00

43620 PLUG TRANSM REAR 

DIFFERENTIAL MAGNETIC 3/4 N/F

EA G696950 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43646 PLUG OIL REAR DIFFERENTIAL 

CHEV OEM 2074951

EA 2074951 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

594 DRYER DESICCANT CARTRIDGE KIT 

BENDIX A-D9 BRAKES GAR/SNDRS

EA 107794X 31 $ 47.5400 $ 1,473.74 $ 27.5000 $ 852.50 No Bid No Bid

77206 FLAP MUD TRUCK EA N/A 50 $ 18.0000 $ 900.00 $ 25.0000 $ 1,250.00 No Bid No Bid

85373 RACE BEARING  OUTER REAR  

INT'L OEM 572

EA 572 1 No Bid $ 15.0000 $ 15.00 $ 21.4000 $ 21.40

85407 RACEBEARING INNER REAR INT'L 

OEM 592A

EA 592A 1 No Bid $ 17.5000 $ 17.50 $ 26.5900 $ 26.59

85613 SHOE REAR BRAKE Q PLUS 16.5X7 EA MA31247071 81 $ 57.2300 $ 4,635.63 $ 48.9900 $ 3,968.19 No Bid

85613CC CORE SHOE REAR ROCKWELL EA XXX 81 $ 34.0000 $ 2,754.00 $ 14.0000 $ 1,134.00 No Bid No Bid

90597 CAMSHAFT REPAIR KIT REAR INT'L 

OEM#KIT8 042

EA KIT8042 33 $ 12.0000 $ 396.00 $ 9.9500 $ 328.35 No Bid No Bid

92395 KIT BRAKE SHOE REPAIR REAR 

INT'L OEM# TA291ATP1877

EA TA291ATP1877 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



94987 SEAL WHEEL REAR 

INT'L/WHITE/VOLVO 2 PC SEAL 

WEAR RING

EA 3929131 38 $ 52.5000 $ 1,995.00 $ 41.0000 $ 1,558.00 No Bid No Bid

95604 BREATHER DIFFERENTIAL 1/8" 

NPT

EA D38663 6 No Bid No Bid

S00266 KIT AIR DRYER 

HEATER/THERMOSTAT 09/UP 

INT'L

EA BX109495 2 $ 90.0000 $ 180.00 $ 99.0000 $ 198.00 No Bid

S00314 CLIP ABS SPEED SENSOR 

RETAINER BENDIX 801534

EA 801534 2 $ 5.0600 $ 10.12 $ 9.6600 $ 19.32 No Bid No Bid

S00557 VALVE PURGE SOFT SEAT 

EVERFLOW BXK031560

EA BENDIX BXK 

031560

1 $ 165.5300 $ 165.53 $ 192.1200 $ 192.12 No Bid No Bid

S00689 DRYER AIR ASSY 10 INT'L 7400 

GARBAGE TRUCK  BENDIX 800801 

OEM ONLY

EA 800801 1 $ 2,100.5000 $ 2,100.50 $ 2,365.0000 $ 2,365.00 No Bid No Bid

S00716 NUT WHEEL 09 FORD F250 OEM 

DORMAN - 2C2Z-1012-AA

EA 2C2Z-1012-AA 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S01006 DRYER AIR KIT COMPLETE AD-9 

SANDERS/GARBAGE TRUCKS

EA 65225 1 $ 240.9700 $ 240.97 $ 170.0000 $ 170.00 No Bid No Bid

S01009 VALVE PURGE KIT AD-IP 10  ISUZU 

SWEEPER BENDIX K022105

EA K022105 2 $ 133.5300 $ 267.06 $ 136.2600 $ 272.52 No Bid No Bid

S01425 RIM WHEEL FRONT 12.25 X 22.5 

10 HOLE 09 INT'L SANDER

EA ACC29807PW 1 $ 813.6500 $ 813.65 $ 990.0000 $ 990.00 No Bid No Bid

S01467 SEAL WHEEL FRONT OIL 2 PIECE 

ALL SANDERS AND GARBAGE 

TRUCKS

EA 382-8064 14 $ 56.0000 $ 784.00 $ 45.5000 $ 637.00 No Bid No Bid

S02017 SHOE BRAKE FRONT SET 15X4 10 

INT'L SHUPAK 4300 GARBAGE 

TRUCK OEM KSMA2124707QP

EA KSMA2124707QP 1 No Bid $ 74.0700 $ 74.07 No Bid No Bid

S02314 VALVE SAFETY RELIEF 200PSI 

SANDERS

EA 800155 1 $ 44.0600 $ 44.06 $ 63.5000 $ 63.50 No Bid No Bid

S02878 VALVE PRESSURE PROTECTION 

DUAL

EA 3820201C1 1 No Bid $ 87.6300 $ 87.63 No Bid No Bid

S03157 KIT AIR DRYER MOUNTING AD-9 EA BW5002080 1 $ 77.5100 $ 77.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S03204 KIT BRAKE SPRING FRONT (FOR 

107649) MERITOR BHK-020

EA BHK020 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



117184 HOSE AIR LINE BLACK 

1/4"SYNFLEX #901413 1000 FT. 

ROLL

FT 901413 153 No Bid No Bid $ 1.5000 $ 229.50 No Bid No Bid

117192 HOSE AIR LINE BLACK 

3/8"SYNFLEX #901433 500 FT. 

ROLL

FT 901433 23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

117200 HOSE AIR LINE BLACK 

1/2"SYNFLEX #901443 500 FT. 

ROLL

FT 901443 42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

117218 HOSE AIR LINE BLACK 

5/8"SYNFLEX #901453 250 FT. 

ROLL

FT 901453 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

117267 HOSE AIR BRAKE 1/2" RUBBER  B 

875

FT N/A 52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1767 HOSE AIR LINE (YELLOW) 3/8" 

(SYNFLEX) 500 FT. ROLL

FT N/A 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1768 HOSE AIR LINE (ORANGE) 3/8" 

(SYNFLEX) 500 FT. ROLL

FT N/A 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1770 HOSE AIR LINE (GREEN) 1/2" 

(SYNFLEX) 500 FT. ROLL

FT N/A 68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1771 HOSE AIR LINE (GREEN) 3/8" 

(SYNFLEX) 500 FT. ROLL

FT N/A 83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1772 HOSE AIR LINE (GREEN) 5/8" 

(SYNFLEX) 250 FT. ROLL

FT N/A 47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3911 HOSE AIR LINE 3/4" BLACK 

SYNFLEX SNDERS /GARBAGE TRKS

FT N/A 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

624 HOSE AIR BLK 5/16"SYNFLEX PT 

1485-5 91 INT'L VAC-ALL

FT N/A 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84038 HOSE AIR BRAKE HARD PLASTIC 

1/8" (PAPCO OEM# 901403)

FT 901403 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S01908 HOSE AIR BRAKE 3/8" RUBBER 

PART # HAB-6-REEL

FT N/A 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S01927 HOSE AIR LINE 5/32" SYNFLEX 

PART # 1485-2-1/2-100

FT N/A 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid
$ 38,479.51 $ 42,934.59 $ 414.74



Line 

Item Item # Description U of M Manufacture item # Quantity Unit price Total Unit price Total

1 1291 HOOK PINTLE 30000 LB PT 43019 EA 43019 9 No Bid No Bid $ 127.9900 $ 1,151.91

2

1292 ADAPTER PINTLE 00-01 STAKE BODY TRUCKS PT 

0699

EA 699 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 1341 JACK TRAILER PART# 85469 EA 85469 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 1580 RIM TRAILER (4 HOLE 4.80 X 8) TRAILERS EA 61-8F4 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 2313 BALL TRAILER 2" HUSKY PART # 33850 EA 33850 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6

S00725 KIT BEARING WHEEL TRAILER 1 3/8" X 1 1/16" 

MACHINABILITY WB138T0700

EA TD81141 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7

S00813 CONTROLLER BRAKE ELECTRONIC TRAILER 09/UP 

TRACKLESS MT-6

EA DT 5500 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8

S01020 PIN HITCH C/W CLIP 5/8" X 3 1/2" ALL 

EQUIPMENT

EA 33791/33792 27 No Bid No Bid $ 2.2900 $ 61.83

9

S01108 SWITCH BREAKAWAY 11 MACHINABILITY 

SIDEWALK SDER TRAILER

EA 34815 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10

S01109 LOCK BEARING TRAILER WHEEL TANG WASHER 

(12 COLPRON)

EA 52595 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11

S01555 SHOE BRAKE L/S SET (DEXTER) 1419 TRI-AXLE EA K71-501-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12

S01556 SHOE BRAKE R/S SET (DEXTER) 1419 TRI-AXLE EA K71-500-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13

S01557 SEAL WHEEL INNER BEARING 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 010-056-00 NATIONAL # 370014A 1 No Bid No Bid $ 27.9900 $ 27.99

14

S01558 CUP BEARING INNER WHEEL 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 031-022-01 NATIONAL #394A 1 No Bid No Bid $ 21.5900 $ 21.59

15

S01559 CUP BEARING OUTER WHEEL 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 031-019-01 NATIONAL # 382A 1 No Bid No Bid $ 14.2900 $ 14.29

16

S01560 CONE BEARING OUTER WHEEL 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 031-019-02 NATIONAL # 387A 1 No Bid No Bid $ 24.5000 $ 24.50

OMB Parts and ServiceReefer repair



17

S01561 CONE BEARING INNER WHEEL 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 031-022-02 NATIONAL #395A 1 No Bid No Bid $ 47.9900 $ 47.99

18

S01562 CAP OIL WHEEL BEARING 14 JJ TRAILERS TRIAXLE 

TILT

EA 021-036-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19

S01563 PLUG OIL WHEEL BEARING CAP 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 045-032-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20

S01564 NUT SPINDLE WHEEL BEARING 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 006-084-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21

S01565 O'RING CAP WHEEL BEARING OIL 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 010-050-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22

S01566 WASHER TANG WHEEL BEARING 14 JJ TRAILERS 

TRIAXLE TILT

EA 005-059-0 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23

S01567 WASHER SPINDLE WHEEL BEARING 14 JJ 

TRAILERS TRIAXLE TILT

EA 005-060-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24

S01635 HOLDER DOCUMENT TRAILER PART # 158CK ALL 

TRAILERS

EA 158CK 3 No Bid No Bid $ 15.1900 $ 45.57

25

S01638 DRUM BRAKE TRAILER (12"X2") 11/UP SIDEWALK 

SANDER TRAILER

EA 31923 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26

S01639 DRUM BRAKE TRAILER (10"X2 1/4") 11/UP 

SIDEWALK SANDER TRAILER

EA 34313 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27

S01642 ASSEMBLY BRAKE R/S ELECTRIC TRAILER (12"X2") 

COLPRON

EA 34336 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28

S01643 ASSEMBLY BRAKE L/S ELECTRIC TRAILER (12"X2") 

COLPRON

EA 34335 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 S02491 SEAL WHEEL INNER (COLPRON) EA TRP GS-1719 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30

S02494 SPRING BRAKE SHOE ADJUSTER (DEXTER) 1419 

TRI-AXLE

EA 046-137-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31

S02495 ASSY BRAKE SHOE/MAGNET R/SIDE (DEXTER) 

1419 TRI-AXLE

EA K23-439-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32

S02496 ASSY BRAKE SHOE/MAGNET R/SIDE (DEXTER) 

1419 TRI-AXLE

EA K23-438-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 S02497 DRUM BRAKE (DEXTER) 1419 TRI-AXLE EA 009-027-01 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34

S02498 SPRING BRAKE SHOE RETURN (DEXTER) 1419 TRI-

AXLE

EA 046-119-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



35

S02499 SPRING BRAKE SHOE CENTERING (DEXTER) 1419 

TRI-AXLE

EA 046-136-00 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36

S02500 PLATE BRAKE SHOE BACKING (DEXTER) 1419 TRI-

AXLE

EA 036-115-22 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 S02920 DRUM HUB ASSY 12" X 2" TRAILER COLPRON EA 31923 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38

S02921 LINK SHACKLE TRAILER SUSPENSION COLPRON EA 32167 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39

S02922 BALANCER SHACKLE TRAILER SUSPENSION 

COLPRON

EA 52951 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40

S02923 BUSHING NYLON 11/16" TRAILER SPRING 

COLPRON

EA 54961 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 S02924 BOLT U TRAILER SPRING COLPRON EA 27-231-2 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 S02925 PLATE ADAPTER TRAILER SPRING COLPRON EA C0191025 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 S02926 SPRING RUBBER TRAILER SPRING COLPRON EA C515-65 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44

S02927 WASHER SPRING RUBBER TRAILER COLPRON EA CA1602-A 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45

S02928 KIT WHEEL BEARING TRAILER COLPRON DEXTER# 

BK3-300

EA BK3-300 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46

S02929 SPRING 4 LEAF TRAILER SUSPENSION COLPRON EA 77436 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 S02956 CAP GREASE WHEEL BEARING COLPRON EA 55-21-42-1 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48

S02957 PLUG GREASE CAP WHEEL BEARING COLPRON EA 55-85-1 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 S03049 SEAL GLAD HAND EA H41736 4 $ 0.9000 $ 3.60 No Bid

50 S03050 HAND GLAD BLUE SERVICE EA GLAD HAND BLUE 1 $ 6.9300 $ 6.93 $ 4.0000 $ 4.00

51 S03051 HAND GLAD RED EMERGENCY EA GLAD HAND RED 1 $ 6.9300 $ 6.93 $ 4.0000 $ 4.00

52

S03062 FITTING BULKHEAD (GLAD HAND) 1" X 3/8" X 

1/2" X 2-5/8"L

EA 12-806 1 $ 6.8900 $ 6.89

53

2419 WIRE TRAILER 7 CORD PT 825611 100' FOR TRLER 

LGHTS/MISC EQUIP

FT 825611 80 $ 2.2500 $ 180.00 $ 1.5500 $ 124.00

Subtotal: $ 197.46 $ 1,534.56



Item # Description unit Manufacturer item # Quantity Unit price Total Unit price Total

102236 CAP ONLY  BREATHER HYD EA TC0015 1 $ 9.9900 $ 9.99

109181 COUPLER QUICK BALL TYPE 

FEMALE  1/2"

EA GOO QS25-04 343 $ 13.9500 $ 4,784.85 $ 13.1500 $ 4,510.45

109199 COUPLER QUICK BALL TYPE MALE  

1/2"

EA GOO QS71-04 347 $ 5.5000 $ 1,908.50 $ 5.8000 $ 2,012.60

109207 COUPLER QUICK BALL TYPE 

FEMALE  3/4"

EA GOO QS25F-06 42 $ 25.7500 $ 1,081.50 $ 41.6600 $ 1,749.72

109215 COUPLER QUICK BALL TYPE MALE  

3/4"

EA GOO QS21F-06 47 $ 12.5000 $ 587.50 $ 25.0500 $ 1,177.35

109223 COUPLER QUICK BALL TYPE 

FEMALE  3/8"

EA B40003F 6 $ 14.1000 $ 84.60 No Bid No Bid

109231 COUPLER QUICK BALL TYPE MALE  

3/8"

EA B40003M 7 $ 7.0000 $ 49.00 No Bid No Bid

1342 ELEMENT HYD FLTER PT SH SE45-

E108 C/W O'R PA 015-236 SNDRS

EA P170606 1 No Bid No Bid $ 59.9900 $ 59.99

1510 GAUGE HYD SIGHT GLASS 

SNA1278S0125 FOR HYD 

RESERVOIRS

EA LVA-20-S-A 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2984 GAUGE C/W HYD LOW LEVEL 

SENSOR STAUFF

EA SNK127VC012R 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S00298 HEAD HYDRAULIC ASSEMBLY 3/4 

NPT PORTS SEQ 68015

EA BAL-0B1318 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S00649 HEAD HYD FILTER 00/UP 

SANDERS SSF-120-25-1 (FITS 287-

10)

EA SSF-120-25-1 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S01455 FILTER HYDRAULIC TANK 

SUCTION 3" NPFT 10 LABRIE 

EXPERT 2000

EA SS-300-0-3 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

OMB Parts & Industrial LtdPBA Industrial 



S02415 GAUGE PRESSURE 0-3000 PSI 

LIQUID FILLED

EA SPG63-3000-P 2 $ 35.0000 $ 70.00 No Bid No Bid

S02977 VALVE PNEUMATIC CONTROL 

SPRING RTN TO CENTER DEL

EA 1221-99-01 1

$ 8,565.95 $ 9,520.10







Economic Update  January 2019

The New Housing Price Index for St. John’s Metro
w as 98.4 in October 2018 dow n -0.5%*

The Consumer Price Index for St. John’s Metro
w as 137.2 in November 2018 up 0.7%*

Retail trade  for New foundland and Labrador w as
$751 million in October 2018 dow n -6.7%*

* same month in the prev ious y ear. Source: Statistics
Canada

 ... as of November 2018
     
Labour Force               121,200 (dow n 0.5%)
Unemployment Rate    8.1% (up 0.6 ppts)
Employment        111,300 (up 0.5%)
Participation Rate         65.3% (up 1.1 ppts)

St. John's CMA, seasonally adjusted, three-month
moving average. Percentage change reflects the same
month previous year. Source: Statistics Canada

Newfoundland and Labrador has Canada’s largest ocean economy 

OceansAdvance, an industry association w ith representatives from the research, academic, industry and
government f ields w orking to foster ocean technology, has released data on the importance of New foundland
and Labrador’s ocean economy to the province. New foundland and Labrador’s total ocean economy is w orth
$16 billion a year and employs 37,000 people — that makes it the biggest single ocean economy in Canada. In
fact, the province represents more than half (53%) of Canada’s total ocean economy. 

Mitacs Accelerate industrial postdoc funding 

Companies that w ant to add a highly skilled member to their teams have until January 18 to apply for Mitacs
funding.  The new  Accelerate industrial program provides up to 3 years of funding valued at $55,000/year for
companies or a not-for-profit to hire a postdoctoral fellow  in any discipline. Companies and organizations gain
a competitive advantage by adding a highly-skilled member to their teams w hile postdoctoral fellow s apply their
expertise to real-w orld problems and build business-ready skills. For more information, visit Mitacs Industrial
postdoc w ebsite.

Economic impacts of Frontier 

The Canadian Media Producers Association (CMPA) has released a study detailing the production of the TV
series’ Frontier economic impact on New foundland and Labrador and Canada. Over three seasons of f ilming,
$41 million has been spent on goods and services in NL for as diverse as after-w ork pints to homes for the
show 's producers, w hile hundreds of crew  members and actors are w orking on the series — 539 full-time
equivalent positions in NL alone. The report estimates economic output from the show  at more than $63

https://www.mitacs.ca/en/programs/accelerate/industrial-postdoc?utm_source=Mitacs+Calls+for+Proposals&utm_campaign=3d22cfe82a-Mitacs-Postdoc-Call-ENG-Nov142018&utm_medium=email&utm_term=0_4fbc5a07d9-3d22cfe82a-121592725
https://www.eventbrite.ca/e/how-do-i-entrepreneur-tickets-50448431617?aff=ebdssbnotavail


million. Economic analysis for the study on Frontier’s economic impact w as carried out by MNP LLP for the
CMPA. The full study is available here.

As of December 31, 2018 the value of:
Commercial permits w ere up 54% to $267,031,227 for 2018 over $173,008,394 for 2017
Industrial permits w ere valued at $5,000 for 2018 and $5,110,000 for 2017
Government/Institutional permits w ere up from $1,952,594 in 2017 to $12,714,170 in 2018*
Residential permits w ere dow n 20% to $71,083,694 for 2018 over $88,735,674 for 2017
Repair permits w ere dow n 20%, from $3,250,698 in 2017 to $2,602,660 in 2018
Total value of all permits w as up 30% to $353,436,751 for 2018 over $272,057,360 for 2017

* Note that this data doe not include the full range of permit activity undertaken by the provincial government and Memorial
University.

Laundry Services NL, 95 Merrymeeting Rd.  
The Zen Den, 15 Goldstone St. 
Rainbow  International of St. John's, 696 Torbay Rd.
The Geek Bar, 288 Duckw orth St. 

Home-based Businesses
Real estate agent, 18 Banikhin Pl 
Admin off ice for vehicle sales, 87 Frecker Dr.  
Massage therapist, 36 Exmouth St. 

2018 Total 154
Regular 106 
Home-based 48

2017 Total 151
Regular 86
Home-based 65

City waiving development fees in
core parts of St. John’s to
encourage growth 

In the 2019 budget St. John’s City Council w aived
development fees to encourage development in
certain areas of the city w here developers may
propose comprehensive plans for
redevelopment. The City’s Envision St. John’s
Municipal Plan sets out eight intensif ication areas
w here there is potential for redevelopment w ith a mix
of land uses – residential, commercial and
institutional. These areas are located on main roads,
serviced by public transit, and near existing
commercial services and schools. 
For additional information contact the Department of
Planning, Engineering and Regulatory Services
at planning@stjohns.ca

Upcoming Events

Jan 15 Ocean Technology Speaker Series Scottish Enterprise Subsea
Opportunity Program
Jan 15 Attract Your Ideal Customer w ith Facebook Ads Manager  
Jan 17 Trade Show  Intelligence w orkshop
Jan 17 Memorial Centre for Entrepreneurship How do I entrepreneur?
Jan 23 Futurpreneur free Entrepreneur Webinar: Market Research 
Jan 24 Business Solutions Pop-up 
Jan 24-25 Ethree Consulting REAL Leadership w orkshop
Feb 6 St. John’s Board of Trade Outlook’19

Department of Community Services | Economic Development, Culture and Partnerships
(709) 576-8107 | business@stjohns.ca | w w w .stjohns.ca

 ​  ​

https://cmpa.ca/wp-content/uploads/2018/12/MNP-2018-Economic-Impacts-of-Frontier-Report.pdf
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http://www.oceansadvance.net
http://www.nlowe.org/event-3172855
http://events.r20.constantcontact.com/register/event?llr=5xtry8dab&oeidk=a07efy51is7e9429694
https://www.eventbrite.ca/e/how-do-i-entrepreneur-tickets-50448431617?aff=ebdssbnotavail
https://www.eventbrite.ca/e/how-do-i-entrepreneur-tickets-50448431617?aff=ebdssbnotavail
https://www.futurpreneur.ca/en/landing-pages/newfoundland-workshops/
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https://ethree.ca/build-real-leadership-skills/?utm_source=NLOWE%27s+Member-Only+Update+-+December+20&utm_campaign=Member+Only+Weekly+update&utm_medium=email
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